Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 6:51 PM

To: admin-d; assignments

Subject: AIS REF: TBC/FR-WC8235Z -: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML5734R & WC8235Z -

DOA :9/12/2022 - VIRTUAL CASE

Internal

Dear Survey Firm,
Please retrieved documents via Allianz FileXchange link below and create claim in Merimen accordingly.

File: WC8235Z - Ol GIA.pdf, SML5734R TP GIA.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=010ad4ec-a866-4d34-9d65-43b4b742026b-
0d604eabec361f09

Size: ~ 2 MByte, Download available until: 12/27/2022

Password: Allianz1

Thank you

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQD | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Sent: 13 December, 2022 06:48 PM

To: 'Lim Jia Haw' <jiahaw.lim@munichautocare.com.sg>; Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>; Leong
Chee Kwong <cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>

Cc: 'Yan (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML5734R & WC8235Z - DOA : 9/12/2022 - VIRTUAL CASE

Your ref: SML5734R
Our ref: TBC/FR-WC8235Z2

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.



Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg
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Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Lim Jia Haw <jiahaw.lim@munichautocare.com.sg>

Sent: 13 December, 2022 03:11 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>; Leong Chee Kwong
<cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML5734R & WC8235Z - DOA : 9/12/2022

To: ALLIANZ Accident Claims Dept. (Arrangement of Surveyor Unit)

RE: NOTICE TO THIRD PARTY INSURERS TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKINGS DAY
PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH PHOTOCOL FOR NIN-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA) ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SML5734R & WC8235Z ALONG LOYANG AVE TOWARDS PASIR RIS.

We are repairer for BIS MOTORING PTE LTD, the owner of vehicle no SML5734R.
Please be informed that the said vehicle can inspected at the following venue:
Munich Autocare Pte Ltd

60 Jalan Lam Huat #06-43 Singapore 737869

Mobile No: 8655 3856 Email: jiahaw.lim@miunichautocare.com.sg
Contact Person: Jia Haw

Please assign Office In Charge to us if we could do direct settlement for this case.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jia Haw

Motor Claims Advisor (B&P Dept)



Email: jiahaw.lim@munichautocare.com.sg

Phone: +65 8655 3856

60, Jalan Lam Huat #07-43, Carros Centre, Singapore 737869
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