Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd <cardoc@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 2:21 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SLA8471Z

Dear Huey Yon
Confirm

Thanks & Regards
Irene

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) [mailto:hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 15 February, 2023 10:12 AM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SLA8471Z

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Without prejudice
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $5,786.80 with 6 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, January 30, 2023 2:03 PM

To: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd <cardoc@singnet.com.sg>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLA8471Z

Hi

+ Adrian
+ SUR team

Our ref: CS/LPC22012471/Any3

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd <cardoc@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, January 30, 2023 10:50 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SLA84717

REMINDER
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Surveyor Adrian
Can finalist?

Thanks & Regards
Irene

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 5 January, 2023 4:30 PM

To: admin-a@lkkauto.com; 'CS A Team'

Subject: SLA8471Z

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Surveyor Adrian
Can finalist?

Thanks & Regards

Irene

From: ApeosPort C2060 [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 5 January, 2023 4:28 PM

To: cardoc@singnet.com.sg

Subject: Scan Data from FX-1C7D22424B92

Number of Images: 10
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort C2060
Device Location:



