Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 10:03 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LKK check MV: FBR4185E / DOA: 27/07/2022
$35k-37k

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 9:53 am

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: LKK check MV: FBR4185E / DOA: 27/07/2022

Dear Taufikh,

Kindly assist to quote the range of MV...thanks.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bin Abdul Karim, Kaharudin <ak.kaharudin@Ilibertyinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 9 December 2022 10:26 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Bin
Sulaiman, Mohd Sharin <Sulaiman.Sharin@Ilibertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: LKK check MV: FBR4185E / DOA: 27/07/2022

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly assist and advise vehicle MV, BMW F900XR Motorcycle.
Please revert via this correspondence email.

Thank you.

Best regards,
Kaharudin
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