Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 July 2023 9:59 AM

To: ‘Charlotte Chew!

Subject: RE: MT/1201119-002/CC = SJD5698P / MID46187 on 13 Dec 2022
Attachments: OFFER LETTER DV_MID46187 v3.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

Attached signed DV.

Please assist to send your payment via internet banking. The bank details are as follow:
Account Name: Permanent Secretary (Defence) / Accountant General

Bank Name: United Overseas Bank

Bank Branch: UOB Main
Account No: 101-367-9377

PwnNpE

Please indicate CY22/MID46187/131222/0043as the reference for payment details and
update us after payment had been processed.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, May 18, 2023 8:45 AM

To: Charlotte Chew <charlotte.chew@income.com.sg>

Subject: RE: MT/1201119-002/CC = SJD5698P / MID46187 on 13 Dec 2022
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Thank you for your offer.

Please assist to amend the payee name in DV before we could get our principal to sign on it. The payment should
pay directly to “PS DEFENCE”.



vour Ref: CCZ/MIDAZ2012432/p
Our Ref: MT/CA/TP/010/1201119-002/CC

2B Apr 2023

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
Ifwe, PS5 DEFENCE

hereby acknowledge and agree that payment by Income Insurance Limited of the sum

of 552433.91 to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD shall be full satisfaction liquidation and discharge of all
claims whatsoever competent upon EXCEL MOTORING &/OR AUTHORISED DRIVER in respect of all loss
injury or damage whether now or hereafter to become manifest arising directly or indirectly from the
above-captioned accident.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, April 28,2023 9:11 AM

To: Charlotte Chew <charlotte.chew@income.com.sg>

Subject: RE: MT/1201119-002/CC = SID5698P / MID46187 on 13 Dec 2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,
Attached as requested.

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Charlotte Chew <charlotte.chew@income.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, April 27, 2023 5:20 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: MT/1201119-002/CC = SJD5698P / MID46187 on 13 Dec 2022

Restricted

Without prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please provide the full police report without any redacted information.

Thank you

Charlotte Chew

Senior Claims Executive
Operations, Motor and Personal Lines

T: +65 6430 7924

(s Income

made yours

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 March 2023 12:06 PM

To: MTCL@income.com.sg

Subject: Recovery Claim For MID46187 // DOA: 13/12/2022 // YOUR INSURED: SJD5698P

Your Ref: To be advised Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22012432/p

M/s INCOME INSURANCE LIMITED

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID46187 AND SJD5698P ALONG T4 UNDERPASS ON 13/12/2022

We refer to the above matter.



We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military vehicles
with effect from December 2021.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and / or management of his vehicle.
As a result of the accident, our principal’s vehicle was damaged and our principal has been put to loss and expense,
particulars of which are as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (MID46187) $2,407.16
2. Insurance Search Fee S 26.75
TOTAL | $2,433.91

A copy of the supporting documents is enclosed.

* Please be note that repairs of MINDEF vehicles involved in accidents are carried out by MINDEF list of appointed
contractors or at the unit’s zonal workshops. There is no survey report of MINDEF vehicles.

Kindly look into the above claim and let us have your settlement within the next 14 days from this letter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies
of it. Thank you.



