Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 12:09 PM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Jared Liu Yaorong

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10019186 /JL || Ol- SCG5007B (Black) TP-SJH5368X|| Est:
$0.00 || KT Motorwerk

Attachments: C10019186 - TP-SJH5368X.zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SJH5368X. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:

KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 5485578

Once the date and time is firm, please inform us and look for John Tee, 98287487 during the inspection.

No TP GIA report.

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 12:00 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 12.12.2022 || C10019186/JL | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH5368X AND SCG5007B ALONG
PUNGGOL WAY TWDS TPE ON 09.12.2022 on 2115HRS

Dear Team,
We would like to get LKK.

Thank you.

Regards,

John Tee,

HP:98287487

KT MOTORWERK

ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 10 December 2022 3:10 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH5368X AND SCG5007B ALONG PUNGGOL WAY TWDS TPE ON 09.12.2022 on
2115HRS

To the officer in charge,
We are the appointed workshop for SJH5368X. The other party SCG5007B (BUDGET DIRECT)
Please arrange for inspection at the following address:

KT MOTORWERK
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

Once the date and time is firm, please inform us and look for John Tee, 98287487 during the inspection.

Regards,

John Tee,

HP:98287487

KT MOTORWERK

ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978
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