Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 5:05 PM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto); chmotor@singnet.com.sg; SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: ALLIANZ-OD DESKTOP SURVEY SMN 2559P DOA: 03/12/2022
Attachments: SMN 2559P mark est_compressed.pdf

Dear Dorlyn,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMN 2559P. Part by part repair.
(Excess $1100/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Please provides parts invoice upon finalize

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 11:02 AM

To: Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@Ikkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ALLIANZ-OD DESKTOP SURVEY SMN 2559P DOA: 03/12/2022

Hi Simon / Veron,
Please do desktop survey, document uploaded in VIEWS, photos in P-drive.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK) <chmamk@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 9 December 2022 3:25 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: ALLIANZ-OD DESKTOP SURVEY SMN 2559P DOA: 03/12/2022

Hi,

Damage photos as per attach.

Thank you.

Rgds

Dorlyn Li

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK)
Tel : 64812001

On Fri Dec 09 2022 14:29:27 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)
<chmotor@singnet.com.sg> wrote:
—————————— Original Message ----------

Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, December 9, 2022 2:27 PM

To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June)

Cc: assignments ; SUR

Subject: ALLIANZ-OD DESKTOP SURVEY SMN 2559P DOA: 03/12/2022

Dear June,
As spoken with you.

Kindy send us the general & damage photographs of SMN 2559P as Allianz Insurance
appoint us to do desktop survey.

Thanks & Regards,



Shiau Chan (Ms)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



