EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 December 2022 4:33 pm

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SBB5445H (Hyundai Elantra) & SGD2622M (Aig) on 08/12/22 ***
LKK REF: CC6/AIG22012336/pa3

Attachments: SBB5445 RB & LOA.pdf

Dear Ezlyna,

We submit our claim as follow :

Repair cost $55320.04
Loss of use S$ 400.00 (5days)

Please let us have your offer to settle

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: JIN AUTO SERVICES [mailto:jin@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 3:00 PM

To: 'EzLyna (LKKAuto)' <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: jouis@jinauto.com.sg; jordan@jinauto.com.sg; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Accident involving SBB5445H (Hyundai Elantra) & SGD2622M (Aig) on 08/12/22 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG22012336/pa3

Hi Lyna,
Kindly establish liability.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jordan



