Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 11:36 AM
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SJQ 6951H

case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the ELarth- FPrint only when necessary-

From: Ryan Teo <ryanteo82@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 11:32 am
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SJQ 6951H

Hi Rasul,

Got it. Pls proceed.

Thanks

Sent from my iPad

On 19 Jan 2023, at 11:26 AM, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,
As spoken. We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $2,200.00./- with 05 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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