Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 10:15 AM
To: Sam San Joi UBI

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMH8662R photos & supp list

Hi Sam,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $41,438.00./- with 08 days of repair subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

From: Sam San Joi UBI <SanJoi.Sam@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 February 2023 10:55 am
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: SMH8662R photos & supp list

Hi Rasul,
Fyi.

Regards
Sam



