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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg
Sent: Thursday, 23 February 2023 5:42 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Claim Documents for our client  SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 Pwith Allianz  

INSURED SLG9530Z *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3
Attachments: LA - SKQ1413R.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Thanks for email. 
 
Client’s LA is already on page 2 of our claim documents. We attached herewith for your reference again. 
 
Our Bank Details as follows 
 
PayNow UEN -m06470300BMBB 
 
Transfer to : Maybank Account - 4210102503 
 
Please do indicate OUR client veh no or OUR claim Ref or Our Tax Invoice no on the payment records. 
 
Do email bank transfer notification to muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg 
 
Thanks ! 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Kee Mui Hong 
Ah Lim Motor Company 
10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#01-09 AMK Autopoint 
Singapore 5680487 
Tel : 64831244  Fax : 64836170 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 23 February 2023 3:40 pm 
To: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Claim Documents for our client SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 Pwith Allianz INSURED SLG9530Z *** LKK 
REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$ 4,495.24(all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  
 



2

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 30 Nov 2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
Thank you.  
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, February 20, 2023 9:58 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Claim Documents for our client SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 Pwith Allianz INSURED SLG9530Z *** LKK 
REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Thanks for the offer. 
 
We are agreeable to the offer. 
 
Please send over DV soonest 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Kee Mui Hong 
Ah Lim Motor Company 
10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#01-09 AMK Autopoint 
Singapore 5680487 
Tel : 64831244  Fax : 64836170 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 4:43 pm 
To: Mui Hong <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: RE: Claim Documents for our client SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 Pwith Allianz INSURED SLG9530Z *** LKK 
REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
WITHOUT PREJDUICE 
 
DEAR SIRS, 
 
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,858.24 
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $100.00) $    500.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 
4. MEDICAL FEE (DRIVER – TAN MING KAI NICHOLAS) $    135.00 

Total $ 4,495.24 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Mui Hong <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, February 7, 2023 6:04 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Claim Documents for our client SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 Pwith Allianz INSURED SLG9530Z *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
Dear Claims, 
 
Please see attached the Claim Documents for our client  SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 Pwith Allianz  INSURED 
SLG9530Z *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
Please advise your offer. 
 
Thanks 
 
Best Regards, 
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Kee Mui Hong  
Ah Lim Motor @ AMK 
10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#01-09 AMK Autopoint S568047 
Tel : 6483 1244  Fax : 6483 6170 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 12:58 PM 
To: Zila @ Ah Lim Motor Company <zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg> 
Cc: Mui Hong @ Ah Lim Motor <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Check Liability - SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 POLICY NO. 5128234010 YOUR INSURED SLG9530Z *** 
LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter.   
 
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under 
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned 
case. 
 
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the 
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the 
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Zila @ Ah Lim Motor Company <zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 December 2022 1:55 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 



5

Cc: Mui Hong @ Ah Lim Motor <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Check Liability - SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 POLICY NO. 5128234010 YOUR INSURED SLG9530Z *** LKK 
REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
My client has video footage. 
Pls refer to it. 
Pls advise liability for this case. 
Thanks! 
 
Regards 
Zila 
Ah Lim Motor (AMK) 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 
#01-09 AMK AUTOPOINT 
S568047 
TEL: 64831244 Fax: 64836170 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 December 2022 1:41 PM 
To: Zila @ Ah Lim Motor Company <zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg> 
Cc: Mui Hong @ Ah Lim Motor <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY - SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 POLICY NO. 5128234010 YOUR INSURED 
SLG9530Z *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22012236/pa3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
 

 

 
 
 Please provide us the following and arrange for survey. 

 evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any) 
 PIR result (if any) 
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Zila @ Ah Lim Motor Company <zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, December 5, 2022 9:49 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: Mui Hong @ Ah Lim Motor <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg> 
Subject: [A/V UNSCANNABLE][EXT] ARRANGE FOR SURVEY - SKQ1413R DOA: 30/11/2022 POLICY NO. 5128234010 
YOUR INSURED SLG9530Z 
 

Warning: This email contains an unscanned attachment. You should not open attachments or click on links unless 
you recognize the sender, expect the email and know the content is safe. 

 

Hi Claims Dept, 
  
Kindly arrange for survey. 
Note: Vehicle is not in – to be arrange. 
  
Pls advise OIC & liability for this case. 
  
Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Zila 
Ah Lim Motor (AMK) 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 
#01-09 AMK AUTOPOINT 
S568047 
TEL: 64831244 Fax: 64836170 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 2:08 PM
To: sean@shariot.com
Subject: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG9530Z (ALLIANZ) AND 

SKQ1413R AT/ALONG JALAN EUNOS BEFORE PIE EXIT TOWARD STILL ROAD ON 
30/11/2022

Rentzilla                                                               [By Email Only] 
DRIVER: Cho Rong Kian 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SLG9530Z 
Our Ref: CC4/AIS22012236/Kpa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG9530Z (ALLIANZ) AND SKQ1413R AT/ALONG JALAN EUNOS BEFORE PIE EXIT TOWARD 
STILL ROAD ON 30/11/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter.  We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SKQ1413R against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.  
  
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your 
policy. We also wish to inform you that there is Section II excess of $2,000.00(Before GST) for third party claim 
settlements. 
  
As Insurers, they shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights 
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third 
party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the 
date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to Allianz and acknowledged by Allianz. 
  
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and 
consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this 
accident, please forward it to us immediately. You may email it to customerservice@allianz.com.sg or deliver it by 
hand to Allianz Customer Care Centre. 
  
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by Allianz of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach 
of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed. 
  
In the event of receiving and handling of any third-party injury claim(s), we shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).  
  
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact as at 6742 3197 or chewht@lkkauto.com. 
  
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
07 Dec
2022
13:34

Clm Dtl
Modified

Insured Name: -> Rentzilla. Insured ID: -> 53449665B. Claimant's Name: -> TAN MOH CHYE ST
EVEN. Claimant's ID: -> S1807223H.

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

2
07 Dec
2022
13:34

Clm Veh Model
Changed (205534) HONDA SHUTTLE 1.5 G CVT (A). [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

3
07 Dec
2022
13:34

Clm Created
Reg No: SKQ1413R. Policy No: SP2001728725. Acct Date: 2022/11/30. Claim Type: TP. Insurer:
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: Income Insurance Limited (HQ). Worksho
p: Ah Lim Motor Company (AMK)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
07 Dec
2022
13:34

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
07 Dec
2022
13:34

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/12/16 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
07 Dec
2022
13:34

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
07 Dec
2022
13:36

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> KENNETH KONG [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

8
15 Feb
2023
16:32

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:5000.00:Hi KC, Total quantum for settlement is less than $5,000.00. Pls assist to approv
e mandate up to $5K in Merimen. Otherwise, we are unable to process to close. Thanks.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

9
15 Feb
2023
16:59

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/12/16 [I] Chan Kian

Chuan

10
15 Feb
2023
16:59

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:5000.00. [I] Chan Kian

Chuan

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2880290 07 Dec 2022
13:34:34

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SKQ1413R RENTZILLA xx.xx

2880308 07 Dec 2022
13:58:23 Video Upload Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SKQ1413R HOW MEI
KWAN xx.xx

2880309 07 Dec 2022
13:58:24 Video Upload Motor

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

Allianz
Insurance

Singapore Pte.
Ltd. (HQ)

SKQ1413R HOW MEI
KWAN xx.xx
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	3917af4bb82304abd001eebdd4f7a07df1744b2915f267dc5b6dff96f098c1e7.pdf
	3917af4bb82304abd001eebdd4f7a07df1744b2915f267dc5b6dff96f098c1e7.pdf
	3917af4bb82304abd001eebdd4f7a07df1744b2915f267dc5b6dff96f098c1e7.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	9a4786ac846d9df050fab4fa163eb2f9dbfc975d0fa359d95e41254ed2facf0d.pdf



