Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Sent: Monday, 10 April 2023 2:04 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Finalization

Cc: 'jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg’; 'Alan Beh';
Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: RE: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Dear Veron,

We accept the final COR L/S $8,100/- with 9 days of repair.
Please assist to follow-up the outcome on the liability.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way, Singapore 508734

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

Kindly note that in accordance with the latest measures introduced by the Government to curb the
spread of the Covid-19 virus, our response may be delayed. seek your understanding on the same.

NOTE : WE HAVE RELOCATED TO : 37 LOYANG WAY 5(508734)

Kindly forward all corresponding to this address with immediate effect.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 April 2023 1:18 pm

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com; Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg' <jessie.o@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
'Alan Beh' <alan.beh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; Andrew.goh@ panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: RE: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Dear Ezel,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $8,100/- with 9 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, April 6, 2023 2:37 PM

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com; Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg' <jessie.o@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
'Alan Beh' <alan.beh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; Andrew.goh@ panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: RE: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Dear Ezel,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $8,100/- with 9 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 30, 2023 5:41 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg'
<jessie.o@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; 'Alan Beh'
<alan.beh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: RE: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Hi,
Can we know you check with whose supplier and please show us the proof enable to accept your final amount.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way, Singapore 508734

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

Kindly note that in accordance with the latest measures introduced by the Government to curb the
spread of the Covid-19 virus, our response may be delayed. seek your understanding on the same.
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NOTE : WE HAVE RELOCATED TO : 37 LOYANG WAY 5(508734)

Kindly forward all corresponding to this address with immediate effect.

From: Finalization <finalization@l|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 March 2023 5:27 pm

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg
<jessie.o@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; 'Alan Beh'
<alan.beh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Hi Ezel,

We have counter check the price is we quote is fair and resonable.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 30, 2023 4:18 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg'
<jessie.o@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg <ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; 'Alan Beh'
<alan.beh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg
<Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>

Subject: RE: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Hi,

Please refer to the attached updated list price | ask from supplier just now.
Why the price adjusts very low. Please check your price again and revert.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg




EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way, Singapore 508734

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

Kindly note that in accordance with the latest measures introduced by the Government to curb the
spread of the Covid-19 virus, our response may be delayed. seek your understanding on the same.

NOTE : WE HAVE RELOCATED TO : 37 LOYANG WAY 5(508734)

Kindly forward all corresponding to this address with immediate effect.

From: Finalization <finalization@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 March 2023 3:46 pm

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg
<jessie.o@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; 'Alan Beh'
<alan.beh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Hi Ezel,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $7800.00 (L/S, before GST), 9 days. Subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 March 2023 10:46:09 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg
<ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; 'Alan Beh' <alan.beh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>;
Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg <Andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>

Subject: RE: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Hi Taufikh,
Please expedite to finalize the COR.
Thank you.

Best Regards,



Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way, Singapore 508734

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

Kindly note that in accordance with the latest measures introduced by the Government to curb the
spread of the Covid-19 virus, our response may be delayed. seek your understanding on the same.

NOTE : WE HAVE RELOCATED TO : 37 LOYANG WAY 5(508734)

Kindly forward all corresponding to this address with immediate effect.

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 14 January 2023 11:03 am

To: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg
Subject: GBK2010B TP FINALIZE - DOA: 27/11/2022

Hi Taufikh,
Please refer to the attached, kindly check and confirm finalize COR L/S $8,650.00 (before GST) with 9 repair days.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way, Singapore 508734

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

Kindly note that in accordance with the latest measures introduced by the Government to curb the
spread of the Covid-19 virus, our response may be delayed. seek your understanding on the same.

NOTE : WE HAVE RELOCATED TO : 37 LOYANG WAY 5(508734)

Kindly forward all corresponding to this address with immediate effect.




