3/2/23, 9:13 AM Re: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SNC 7386J Ref: AVS22/3309 - Renee Sia (LKK Auto) - Outlook
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Re: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SNC 7386J) Ref: AVS22/3309

From: Seah, Andy <Seah.Andy@Ilibertyinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2023 8:09 PM

To: Renee Sia (LKK Auto) <reneesia@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SNC 7386J Ref: AVS22/3309

Any resurvey photo?

Thanks

Best Regards
ANDY SEAH
Claim Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd

51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House
Singapore 069428

DID: (65) 63280767

e |

PROUD PARTHNER

From: Renee Sia (LKK Auto) <reneesia@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2023 3:39 PM

To: Seah, Andy <seah.andy@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Lim, Stewart <Jlim.stewart@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Seah, Ted <seah.ted@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; Work
Shop Estimate (SG) <workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: {EXTERNAL} Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SNC 7386J Ref: AVS22/3309

Dear Andy,

Enclose Survey Report of SNC 7386J.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Renee | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Email: report@]lkkauto.com
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