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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 7 December 2022 11:34 AM
To: YT(HQ); SUR
Cc: info@yewteegroup.com; 'YTKB'
Subject: RE: SLH 3410X-DOA: 29/11/2022 (ECICS OD) 

Dear Shaun, 
 
 
As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLH 3410X. Part by part repair. 
(Excess $0-). 
 
If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  
 
All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 
before completion of the repair. 
 
*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 
 
Please provides parts invoice upon finalize 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: YT(HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 6 December 2022 12:01 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: info@yewteegroup.com; 'YTHQ' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SLH 3410X-DOA: 29/11/2022 (ECICS OD)  
Importance: High 
 
Hi Veron  
 
We have check and there is totally no used parts in the market for this vehicle 
 
Hence if offer on lump sum repair  
 
example  
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Frt door $550.00 + 10% less 20% = $484.00 
 
hence is already below our cost to purchase the parts  
 
can u pls advise officer on it. How to go about?  
 
Thanks  
 
 
 
Best Regards 
Shaun Toh L M 

  
Business account WhatsApp: 6702 3323  
Website: www.yewteegroup.com 
Like Us On Facebook & Instagram 
  
Senior Manager of  
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD 
-YEW TEE (CAMBODIA) AUTOMOBILE CO. LTD 
-SE OPULENCE GROUP 
-ARUKORU BAR 
 
Branch Office: 
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 
Unit No #01-60 
Singapore 417800 
DID: 6702 3113 
Fax: 6702 3773 
Email: info@yewteegroup.com 
P please consider the environment before printing this email 
Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is 
intended solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please 
reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or 
otherwise disclose its contents to any person 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 6, 2022 8:08 AM 
To: YT(HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SLH 3410X-DOA: 29/11/2022 (ECICS OD)  
 
Dear Sir, 
 
 
As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLH 3410X. Lump Sum Repair. 
(Excess $0-). 
 
If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  
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All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 
before completion of the repair. 
 
*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 


