Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 2 December 2022 10:52 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim - Your Insured: YN7723G / Our Claimant: SKM681K
Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 December 2022 8:04 PM

To: Shawn Chua <shawn.chua.cr@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: Third Party Claim - Your Insured: YN7723G / Our Claimant: SKM681K

Internal

Your ref: SKM681K
Our ref: 2022 22008557FR-YN7723G

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Mr Shawn Chua

Insurance Claims Officer

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042
T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0685

Thank you.



Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQ | Allianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Portnar

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Shawn Chua <shawn.chua.cr@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, December 1, 2022 5:20 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Keion Toh <keion.toh@porsche.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Derek Oh
<derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL - Claims Admin
<claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Eurokars Services <info-espl@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Third Party Claim - Your Insured: YN7723G / Our Claimant: SKM681K

Your Insured: YN7723G
Our Claimant: SKM681K

Good afternoon.

We are assisting our claimant, SKM681K to claim against your insured, YN7723G.
Attached is SKM681K GIA report for your perusal.

We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability / status of this claim.
Survey will be arrange & estimate provided at a later date.

Thanks.

Mr Shawn Chua

Insurance Claims Officer

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042

T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0685
E: shawn.chua.cr@eurokars.com.sg W: www.eurokarsgroup.com

(®) ELROKARS SERVICES




