Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 January 2023 11:19 AM

To: thomas@boxfresh.com.sg

Cc: kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg; 'Eu carrie'; karine@boxfresh.com.sg; alex@boxfresh.com.sg; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Repair estimate for SG5075P(2)

Hi Mr Thomas,

noted with thanks

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=~ Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: thomas@boxfresh.com.sg <thomas@boxfresh.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 January 2023 11:05 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg <kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg>; 'Eu carrie' <carrie@boxfresh.com.sg>; karine@boxfresh.com.sg <karine@boxfresh.com.sg>; alex@boxfresh.com.sg
<alex@boxfresh.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Repair estimate for SG5075P(2)

Dear Rasual
Thanks and accept
Please see attached post inspection photos as requested

Thanks and regards

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 31, 2023 10:55 AM

To: thomas@boxfresh.com.sg

Cc: kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg; Eu carrie <carrie@boxfresh.com.sg>; karine@boxfresh.com.sg; alex@boxfresh.com.sg
Subject: Re: Repair estimate for SG5075P(2)

Hi Mr Thomas,
As spoken,
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $650.00./- with 02 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=~ Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: thomas@boxfresh.com.sg <thomas@boxfresh.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 January 2023 1:38 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg <kmeu@boxfresh.com.sg>; Eu carrie <carrie@boxfresh.com.sg>; karine@boxfresh.com.sg <karine@boxfresh.com.sg>; alex@boxfresh.com.sg
<alex@boxfresh.com.sg>

Subject: Repair estimate for SG5075P(2)

Dear Mr Rasul
As estimate was sent to you via hp on 4 Jan 23.
Attaching here again and hope to receive your repair estimate soonest.

Thanks and regards



Thomas Hoo

Business Development Manager
Box Fresh Pte Ltd

HP: 97898644

Mail : thomas@boxfresh.com.sg




