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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: twinauto@singnet.com.sg
Sent: Monday, 10 April 2023 1:22 PM
To: Finalization
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: GBE 1770D---CS/FCI22012044/Tvy3

Hi Veron  
 
We accept the amount of COR at $4,400.00 (L/S before GST) / 5 days. 
 
Thank you 
Regards  
 
Twin Wheels Auto Trading Enterprise  
Tel: 6457 0410 
 
 

On Fri Apr 07 2023 00:06:11 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) Finalization 
<finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
---------- Original Message ---------- 
Hi Sirs, 
 
We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $4400.00  (L/S, before GST), 5 days. 
Subject to their approval. 
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
Thanks. 
  
 

Best Regards, 
Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, April 6, 2023 4:15 PM 
To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: GBE 1770D---CS/FCI22012044/Tvy3  
  

Hi, 

  

Kindly assist 

  

 

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

 


