Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 June 2023 9:01 AM

To: Woon Meng

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalisation for OD Claim: XE6697P || DOA: 26/11/2022
Hi Ms Heng,

As per our message, the finalised amount is incorrect. It was supposed to be $ 25,059.96.

Sorry for the inconvenient cause

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

iy Save the Larth- FPrint only when rnecessary-

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June 2023 11:45 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for OD Claim: XE6697P | | DOA: 26/11/2022

Dear Ms Heng,

Any updates?

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 1, 2023 9:21 AM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Finalisation for OD Claim: XE6697P | | DOA: 26/11/2022

Hi Ms Heng,



As per our message,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $26,742.37 /- with 10 days of repair
before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Sl Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 April 2023 11:37 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation for OD Claim: XE6697P | | DOA: 26/11/2022

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Kindly assist to finalise for this case.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 3:23 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: OD Claim: XE6697P || DOA: 26/11/2022

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly assist to find enclosed estimate & supplementary & supplier invoices for your reference.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,



Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 March 2023 2:49 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Meng Yan (LKK Auto)' <mengyan@Ilkkauto.com>; 'SUR'
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OD Claim: XE6697P || DOA: 26/11/2022

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly assist to find enclosed supplier invoices for your reference. Kindly assist to finalise for this case.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 2 March 2023 1:51 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Meng Yan (LKK Auto)' <mengyan@Ilkkauto.com>; 'SUR'
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OD Claim: XE6697P || DOA: 26/11/2022

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly assist to finalise for this case.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 January 2023 5:00 PM

To: 'Meng Yan (LKK Auto)' <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OD Claim: XE6697P || DOA: 26/11/2022




Dear Meng Yan,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly assist to arrange re-survey for vehicle XE6697P (before-paint).

Address: 28, Gul Drive, 5(629476)

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 December 2022 12:13 PM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD Claim: XE6697P || DOA: 26/11/2022

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Sur,

Kindly assist. Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 5 December 2022 10:35 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: OD Claim: XE6697P || DOA: 26/11/2022

Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Kindly assist to advise if vehicle XE6697P has been authorised for repair.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,



Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050



