Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Wendy Khoo <wendy@autobacs.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 February 2023 11:18 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalization for vehicle YQ852Y Mitsubishi Canter
Hi Taufikh,

We confirm the offer at L/S $9,150.00 (before GST) with 14 working days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Wendy

AUTOBACS CAR CARE SINGAPORE PTELTD
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #08-40/45/46

Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6702 1555

Email:

&Aavrosacs

—1ry7x

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 6:04 PM

To: Wendy Khoo <wendy@autobacs.com.sg>

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalization for vehicle YQ852Y Mitsubishi Canter

Hi Wendy,

Please refer attached, COR I/s $9150, 14 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Wendy Khoo <wendy@autobacs.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 December 2022 4:04 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin <admin@autobacs.com.sg>

Subject: Finalization for vehicle YQ852Y Mitsubishi Canter

Dear Taufikh,



Please kindly assist us to finalize the vehicle YQ852Y.
Attached after paint photos and estimate marked for your reference.

Parts : $4,061.40 after -25%

S/Nett: $9,280.00

Labour: $2,870.00

L/S Total: $12,969.12 with 14 working days

Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Wendy

AUTOBACS CAR CARE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #08-40/45/46

Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6702 1555

Email: wendy@autobacs.com.sg
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