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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 November 2022 12:05 PM
To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto); SUR
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: AIS REF: TBC/JK - SMM6871R - OD Claim - DOA: 28.11.2022 

Internal 
 
Hi Yan, 
 
Please proceed. 
 
Thanks 
 
 
Janice Koh 
Claims Specialist 
Claims & Performance Management 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 www.allianz.sg 
 
 
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain 
confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or 
disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-
mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
? Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: 29 November, 2022 11:58 AM 
To: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: AIS REF: TBC/JK - SMM6871R - OD Claim - DOA: 28.11.2022 
 
Internal 
 
Dear Janice, 
 
For this case, we suggest to carry out physical inspection instead of desktop due to the potential high claim cost 
given the extent of damage. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Yan | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 
1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
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From: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 29 November 2022 11:09 AM 
To: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: AIS REF: TBC/JK - SMM6871R - OD Claim - DOA: 28.11.2022 
 
Internal 
 
Hi LKK, 
 
Please made arrangement to conduct survey for OD vehicle SMM6871R. 
 
Claim created in Merimen Portal and update us with your prelim report once surveyor had conducted survey for our 
authorization/approval/policy clearance. 
 
Excess: $NIL 
 
 
Thank you 
Janice Koh 
Claims Specialist 
Claims & Performance Management 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 www.allianz.sg 
 
 
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain 
confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or 
disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-
mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
? Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Sent: 29 November, 2022 08:35 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] OD Claim SMM6871R 
 
Hi, 
 
Attach document for your perusal. This is OD Claim. 
 
Thank you 
 
Regards 
 
Thomas Pang 


