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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 3:52 PM

To: Karen Ting (LKKAuto); Ernest Khong; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Cc: Alice Lee; Accounts (LKK Auto); Shaqilah (LKK Auto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd>  Honda Jazz  - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M  ( Inv. 

AC2300616 )- Survey Report

Attachments: LKKInspection (1).pdf

Dear Ernest, 

 

 

1. Have you informed the workshop to proceed with the repair? Or are you aware whether they have already 

commenced repair?-Vehicle had commenced repair  

2. We did not find your advice on the estimate duration of repair in your report. Please advise-Refer attach 

3. Has the workshop agreed to the proposed lump sum repair cost of S$4,800-Yes 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 2:15 PM 

To: Ernest Khong <ernest.khong@mclarens.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Adrian Ling 

(LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Shaqilah (LKK Auto) 

<shaqilah@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

 

Dear  Veron/Adrian, 

 

Kindly do advice Ernest Khong on the below mentioned, thank you. 

 
 

 

Best Regards,                                                                                                    

Karen Ting | Accounts Dept.  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd                   

Phone: 6741 2674 Ext.127 | email: KarenTing@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended 

recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender 

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  
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From: Ernest Khong [mailto:ernest.khong@mclarens.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 12:56 PM 

To: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Shaqilah (LKK Auto) 

<shaqilah@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Dear Karen, 

 

Thank you for your report. 

 

We seek your advice on the following: - 

 

1. Have you informed the workshop to proceed with the repair? Or are you aware whether they have already 

commenced repair? 

2. We did not find your advice on the estimate duration of repair in your report. Please advise 

3. Has the workshop agreed to the proposed lump sum repair cost of S$4,800? 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind regards,  

Ernest Khong ACLA, ANZIIF (Snr Assoc) CIP| McLarens 

Senior Engineering Adjuster 

Ernest.Khong@mclarens.com 

 

61 Robinson Road 

#09-01, 61 Robinson 

Singapore 068893 

+65 6856 0606 | Office 

+65 9732 9763 | Hp 

www.mclarens.com 

 
 

From: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 9:57 AM 

To: Ernest Khong <ernest.khong@mclarens.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Shaqilah (LKK Auto) 

<shaqilah@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Dear Ernest, 

 

Thank you for your payment. 

 

Enclosed herewith the invoice and survey report for the vehicle No.: SMK 4078M. 

 

 
 

Best Regards,                                                                                                    

Karen Ting | Accounts Dept.  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd                   
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Phone: 6741 2674 Ext.127 | email: KarenTing@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended 

recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender 

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  
 

 

 

From: Ernest Khong [mailto:ernest.khong@mclarens.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 February 2023 4:32 PM 

To: Shaqilah (LKK Auto) <shaqilah@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Dear Shaqilah, 

 

Please find the transaction advice attached. 

 

We look forward to receiving your report. 

 

Kind regards,  

Ernest Khong ACLA, ANZIIF (Snr Assoc) CIP| McLarens 

Senior Engineering Adjuster 

Ernest.Khong@mclarens.com 

 

61 Robinson Road 

#09-01, 61 Robinson 

Singapore 068893 

+65 6856 0606 | Office 

+65 9732 9763 | Hp 

www.mclarens.com 

 
 

From: Shaqilah (LKK Auto) <shaqilah@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, February 6, 2023 5:00 PM 

To: Ernest Khong <ernest.khong@mclarens.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Dear Ernest, 

 

There is no issue for III to proceed with the payment to acc no. starting  with 339. 

 

For future assignments, both acc no. will do. However, they need to email us the payment details, therefore I can 

check with my respective colleagues. 

 

Thank you! 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Shaqilah| Account 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6741-2674 Ext.126  | email: Account@LKKAuto.com | fax: 6844-8805 
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Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended 

recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender 

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  
 

 

From: Ernest Khong <ernest.khong@mclarens.com>  

Sent: Monday, 6 February 2023 4:12 PM 

To: Shaqilah (LKK Auto) <shaqilah@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Dear Shaqilah, 

 

Thank you for your prompt response. 

 

III have already commenced the processing of your fees to the bank acc no. starting with 339. Is there any issue for 

them to proceed or would you require them to amend to the account no starting with 116?  

 

For future assignments, would LKK be accepting fees payment to bank acc no starting with 339 or 116? This is so 

that they can amend/keep their record, doing away with the need to go through this process again. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind regards,  

Ernest Khong ACLA, ANZIIF (Snr Assoc) CIP| McLarens 

Senior Engineering Adjuster 

Ernest.Khong@mclarens.com 

 

61 Robinson Road 

#09-01, 61 Robinson 

Singapore 068893 

+65 6856 0606 | Office 

+65 9732 9763 | Hp 

www.mclarens.com 

 
 

From: Shaqilah (LKK Auto) <shaqilah@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: 06 February 2023 01:21 PM 

To: Ernest Khong <ernest.khong@mclarens.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Dear Ernest, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

We confirm and kindly make a payment through this account: 116-311-126-3 

 

Thank you! 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Shaqilah| Account 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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phone: 6741-2674 Ext.126  | email: Account@LKKAuto.com | fax: 6844-8805 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended 

recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender 

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  
 

From: Ernest Khong <ernest.khong@mclarens.com>  

Sent: Monday, 6 February 2023 12:40 PM 

To: Shaqilah (LKK Auto) <shaqilah@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Dear Shaqilah, 

 

Please assist to confirm your bank account details as the one registered in III’s system is different from the one you 

have provided. 

 

Currently Provided : 339-301-993-8 

Registered in system: 116-311-126-3 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind regards,  

Ernest Khong ACLA, ANZIIF (Snr Assoc) CIP| McLarens 

Senior Engineering Adjuster 

Ernest.Khong@mclarens.com 

 

61 Robinson Road 

#09-01, 61 Robinson 

Singapore 068893 

+65 6856 0606 | Office 

+65 9732 9763 | Hp 

www.mclarens.com 

 
 

From: Shaqilah (LKK Auto) <shaqilah@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: 03 February 2023 10:46 AM 

To: Ernest Khong <ernest.khong@mclarens.com> 

Cc: Alice Lee <Alice.Lee@mclarens.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: <McLarens Singapore Pte Ltd> Honda Jazz - Vehicle No: SMK 4078M ( Inv. AC2300616 )- Survey Report 

 

Warning: This email originated from an external sender. 

  

Dear Ernest, 

 

We have completed the survey report for the above. 

 

Enclosed herewith the invoice for your payment. 

 

The report will be email to you once payment has been made. 
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Kindly refer below for our bank details, please notify us once the payment has done. Thank you! 

 

Name of Bank Account LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 

Name of Bank UOB Ltd 

Bank – Branch No. 7375 - 016 

Account No. 339-301-993-8 

Email address for remittance advice account@lkkauto.com 

PAYNOW ID 199607198R002 

Swift Code UOVBSGSG 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Shaqilah| Account 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6741-2674 Ext.126  | email: Account@LKKAuto.com | fax: 6844-8805 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended 

recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender 

immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.  
 

 

 

 

PRIVACY STATEMENT: We are required to capture and process personal information supplied to us in the fulfilment 

of our services. Our obligations vary depending on the jurisdiction involved. For further details as to how this 

information is used, kept secure and your rights, please see the relevant Privacy Statement on our website 

– https://www.mclarens.com/privacy-policy/ 


