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Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)

From: Xin Yu  (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, November 25, 2022 12:00 PM
To: Bin Abdul Karim, Kaharudin
Cc: SUR
Subject: RE: LKK check MV: SNC2873C / DOA: 14/11/2022

Dear Kaharudin, 
 
The MV of SNC 2873C is $218k-$220k(Est) as at Nov 2022. 
 
Thanks and Warmest Regards, 

Xin Yu  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Bin Abdul Karim, Kaharudin <ak.kaharudin@libertyinsurance.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, November 22, 2022 9:52 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: LKK check MV: SNC2873C / DOA: 14/11/2022 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Kindly assist and advise vehicle MV, Bentley Continental GTC 6.0 A 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best regards, 
Kaharudin 
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