Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 10:31 AM

To: AIGSS Claims Recovery

Cc: Laili, Shahzlan; SUR

Subject: RE: AIGEncrypt: Request for Market Value SNE5482S : Our Ref: 0182657402SG ; Your

Ref: To be Advised

Dear Sir/Mdm,

The market value for SNE 5482S is $112k-113k (Est) as at Oct 2022

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 November 2022 5:08 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <shirleyhiew@Ikkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang
(LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Laili, Shahzlan <Shahzlan.Laili@aig.com>; AIGSS Claims Recovery <GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com>

Subject: AIGEncrypt: Request for Market Value SNE5482S : Our Ref: 0182657402SG ; Your Ref: To be Advised

Hi LKK Survey Team

Reference to above, grateful if you can assist us to provide the Market Value of this vehicle at the Date of Accident
(25/10/2022).

Please find attached details for your reference.

(We have already settled the OD claim and are seeking recovery for our losses and the other insurers are now
requesting for additional independent valuation).

Do appreciate your kind assistance, thank you.

Intan Syazatul Syima Rejab

AlIG

Recovery Representative — Claims Recovery
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #10-16 Singapore 079120
Tel 65-68307871
GRS-ExpressRecovery@aig.com | www.aig.sg




