Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: joshua@falconair.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 2:34 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto); Finalization

Cc: SUR; anna@falconair.com.sg

Subject: RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441) DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Huey Yon,

COR confirm.

Thanks and regards,

Joshua Ng

Falcon-Air Auto Services (Tampines)
Tel: 67897997

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 1:39 pm

To: joshua@falconair.com.sg; Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441J DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Joshua,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of final fig $8,633.20 before GST and Excess $3,100.00 with 7 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: joshua@falconair.com.sg <joshua@falconair.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 February 2023 10:14 AM

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441) DOA:22/11/2022

Hi Sir/Mdm,

The labour should be $2630.
Kindly check.

Thanks and regards,

Joshua Ng

Falcon-Air Auto Services (Tampines)
Tel: 67897997



From: Finalization <finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 6:33 pm

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: joshua@falconair.com.sg

Subject: Allianz OD claim for SNB441) DOA:22/11/2022

Hi Huey Yon,

Finalize checked already. $8583.20 (P/P, before GST and Excess). 7 days.

Best Regards,

case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: joshua@falconair.com.sg <joshua@falconair.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, February 9, 2023 1:53 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Finalization <finalization@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441) DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please see attach for SNB441) adjusted estimate, supplementary, supplier invoice and after paint photos.
Before paint photos | have whatsapp to steve.

Kindly confirm COR at P/P $8,918.20 (before GST and excess)

Excess:$3100

Thanks and regards,

Joshua Ng

Falcon-Air Auto Services (Tampines)
Tel: 67897997

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 8:20 am

To: Joshua Ng <joshua@falconair.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441J DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Joshua,



As per your requested.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Joshua Ng <joshua@falconair.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 8:15 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ***SPAM*** RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441) DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Huey Yon,
Can i have the marked estimate?

Regards,
Joshua Ng

Get BlueMail for Android
On 25 Nov 2022, at 08:13, "Huey Yon (LKKAuto)" <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Joshua,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SNB 441) (Excess $3,100/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933




From: joshua@falconair.com.sg <joshua@falconair.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 10:07 AM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441) DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Yan,

Would like to request for part by part repair.

Thanks and regards,

Joshua Ng

Falcon-Air Auto Services (Tampines)
Tel: 67897997

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 9:42 am

To: joshua@falconair.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Allianz OD claim for SNB441) DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Joshua,

Received with thanks.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: joshua@falconair.com.sg <joshua@falconair.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 November 2022 4:34 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Allianz OD claim for SNB441J DOA:22/11/2022

Dear Yan,

Please see attach for SNB441J accident damage photos.

Thanks and regards,

Joshua Ng

Falcon-Air Auto Services (Tampines)
Tel: 67897997



