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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 8 May 2023 12:26 PM
To: kendra.twn@hotmail.com
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59103 AND SKT92Z ALONG BEDOK RIA CRESCENT 

ON 25/10/2022
Attachments: Receipt MID 59103 payment confirmation.pdf

Dear Ms Tan, 
 
Please find attached the receipt for MID 59103 confirming payment has been received.  
 
We will proceed to close file. Thanks. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 2:50 PM 
To: kendra.twn@hotmail.com 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59103 AND SKT92Z ALONG BEDOK RIA CRESCENT ON 25/10/2022 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Please update/ advise us on our below email. 
 
Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: - 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 1:54 pm 
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To: kendra.twn@hotmail.com <kendra.twn@hotmail.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59103 AND SKT92Z ALONG BEDOK RIA CRESCENT ON 25/10/2022  
  
Your Ref: SKT92Z                                          Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22011754/p 
  
Dear Ms Tan Wei Neng, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59103 AND SKT92Z ALONG BEDOK RIA CRESCENT ON 25/10/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military 
vehicles with effect from December 2021. 
  
As per our tele-conversation earlier, enclosed below is the breakdown of our claim if you would like to settle the 
matter privately: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (MID59103) $ 59.26 
2. Insurance Search Fee $   2.00 

TOTAL $ 61.26 
  
Please assist to send your payment via internet banking. The bank details are as follow:  
  
1.       Account Name:  Permanent Secretary (Defence) / Accountant General 
2.       Bank Name:  United Overseas Bank   
3.       Bank Branch:  UOB Main   
4.       Account No:  101-367-9377 
  
Please CY22/MID59103 /251022/0036 as the reference for payment details and update us after payment had been 
processed. 
  
Please call us if you have any question. Thank you. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  


