Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 4:13 PM
To: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SCK 9779 J - finalise
Attachments: SCK 9779 marking.pdf

Hi Pat,

COR $465, 2 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 1:04 pm

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SCK 9779 J - finalise

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Taufikh,

Please see attached after paint photos and finalized calculation.
COR $465.00 before GST.
2 days.

Thanks & regards,
Pat
Shu Fatt Auto Works



