Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: enquiry@sinsheng.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 3 January 2023 9:36 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Quek Beng Hoe
Subject: Re: GBF 5380P FINALISE

Dear Taufikh,

We are agreeable to the offer. We shall submit our Final Repair Bill and Discharge Voucher in a separate email.

Thank You
Regards

M/S Sin Sheng Auto Workshop

On 2023-01-03 10:48, Taufikh (LKKAuto) wrote:
> Hi Hoe,

>

> Please refer attached, COR I/s $5000, 7 days.
>

> Regards

>

> Taufikh

>

> Lkk Auto



