Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Irfan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 December 2022 11:51 AM
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SFW 31T FIANALISE

From: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 21 December 2022 11:05 am
To: Irfan (LKK Auto) <irfan@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SFW 31T FIANALISE

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Irfan,

We accept the finalized amount of LS $4200/ 5-days of repair for Vehicle number: SFW 31 T.
We will follow up with the LOD shortly.

Thank you!
The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Regards,

Cristina

Motor Claims Department
BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD



