11/22/22, 12:39 PM Mail - Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: TP DS claim: [EXT] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV3720C AND YP1116M ALONG
SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4 X SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 3 ON 16/11/2022 AT
ABOUT 0850HOURS

Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ilkkauto.com>
Tue 22/11/2022 12:16 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>;Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 November 2022 11:27 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Hazel Natasya Chng <hazel@abwinm9.com>

Subject: TP DS claim: [EXT] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV3720C AND YP1116M ALONG SERANGOON NORTH
AVENUE 4 X SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 3 ON 16/11/2022 AT ABOUT 0850HOURS

Internal

Your ref: SLV3720C

Our ref: SVRAISCL2022-00070KC-YP1116M

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey,.

17 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-58/59/60/61/62 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809
Hazel Chng T +65 6713 9408 | Mobile +65 91991691

Thank you.
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Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQD | Allianz @ | (.o

Warldeeldes Obpmplc and Poralymplc Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.

Thank you.

&5 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Hazel Natasya Chng <hazel@abwinm9.com>

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 8:10 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV3720C AND YP1116M ALONG SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4 X
SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 3 ON 16/11/2022 AT ABOUT 0850HOURS

Hi Shanti,

We refer to your email below.

Please kindly find attached as per requested.

Kindly advise whether your insured and/or insured driver has lodged the accident report.
Please let us have your liability clearance.

Thank you and regards,
Hazel Chng

Claims Department
ABWIN MP Automobite Pre Lid

cee==3 M9 International Pte Lid

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

T +65 6713 9408 | Mobile +65 91991691 | F +65 6713 9415
No. 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4

#01-60 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 17 November 2022 9:59 pm
To: Hazel Natasya Chng <hazel@abwinm9.com>
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Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV3720C AND YP1116M ALONG SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4 X
SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 3 ON 16/11/2022 AT ABOUT 0850HOURS

Internal

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly provide us your client's GIA report and the LTA search.
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQP | Alianz @ | (.

Werldeide Olymp and Paralymglc Parinars

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

From: Hazel Natasya Chng <hazel@abwinm9.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 5:27 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV3720C AND YP1116M ALONG SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4 X
SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 3 ON 16/11/2022 AT ABOUT 0850HOURS

Hi,
We refer to the above matter.

We have been appointed by the owner, MR JEN WEI ZUN, the registered owner of vehicle no. SLV3720C.

Kindly advise if your insured and/or insured driver has lodged a report regarding the above mentioned accident.

Please let us have your liability clearance for the above accident to proceed on with the claims.

Kindly arrange your surveyor to attend the Pre-repair inspection within 2 working days.
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The said vehicle can be inspected at: 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-58/59/60/61/62 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809.

Please note that if you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening
Saturday, Sunday and/or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without any further notice or
reference to you.

Thank you and regards,
Hazel Chng

Claims Department
ABWIN M2 Automobile Pre Lid

==y M9 Internationsl Pie Lid
Abwin Service Pte Ltd
T +65 6713 9408 | Mobile +65 91991691 | F +65 6713 9415
No. 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4
#01-60 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809
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