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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 24 March 2023 10:51 PM
To: Tan Lee Gek (StridesASvcs/Ins & Claims/Claims/Taxi); EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: Re: LOD   Re: Accident on 21/11/2022 involving SHB 5159M & SMS 6309S (AIG's 

insured)  Our Ref: TAX/11/22/2042/lg 
Attachments: SHB5159M-video.mp4; 11 22 2042 - documents.pdf; GIA report of SHB5159M.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email.  
 
Our respective case handler, Lyna will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.  
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  

Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Tan Lee Gek (StridesASvcs/Ins & Claims/Claims/Taxi) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 24 March 2023 10:37 am 
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 21/11/2022 involving SHB 5159M & SMS 6309S (AIG's insured) Our Ref: 
TAX/11/22/2042/lg  
  
Dear All, 
  
We quantify our claim as follows:-  

       
Cost of Repair $2,250.00           
Loss of Rental $704.06 ( 7 days x $100.58 ) 
Loss of Income $420.00 ( 7 days x $60.00 ) 
GEAR Search Fee $2.00           
Total $3,376.06           

  
We enclose the following documents:-  

1) Repair invoice  
2) Proof of rental rate 
3) GIA report  
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5) Hirer’s letter of authorisation  












