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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 30 November 2022 10:10 AM
To: ENG HUEY NI
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLE NOS : GBG7628H, GBB8061L  BD4028A AT 

SIMS AVENUE, LOR 13 JUNCTION ON 30/10/22 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22011666/Gpa3  
// Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026512

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
-              TP estimated cost of repair 
-              Preliminary advice 
 
Please advise investigation outcome. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 26 November 2022 2:52 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLE NOS : GBG7628H, GBB8061L BD4028A AT SIMS AVENUE, LOR 13 
JUNCTION ON 30/10/22 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22011666/Gpa3 // Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026512 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Hi Mei Kwan, 
 
We attach OI GIA for your perusal. 
 
For this case, please do not agree for Direct settlement yet as we will be investigating further into the accident for 
potential breach of the term and condition of the motor policy by the insured driver. 
 
Thanks 
 
Huey Ni 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 12:48 pm 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLE NOS : GBG7628H, GBB8061L BD4028A AT SIMS AVENUE, LOR 13 
JUNCTION ON 30/10/22 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22011666/Gpa3 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
Insured has not lodged the report and we are making enquiries. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 12:11 pm 
To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLE NOS : GBG7628H, GBB8061L BD4028A AT SIMS AVENUE, LOR 13 
JUNCTION ON 30/10/22 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22011666/Gpa3 
 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

We refer to the above matter. 

Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action. 

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong. 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 10:38 AM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLE NOS : GBG7628H, GBB8061L BD4028A AT SIMS AVENUE, LOR 13 
JUNCTION ON 30/10/22 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 8:12 AM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLE NOS : GBG7628H, GBB8061L BD4028A AT SIMS AVENUE, LOR 13 
JUNCTION ON 30/10/22 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/026512 ( Huey Ni’s case) 
 
Dear Meng Yan, 
 
FYNA. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
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From: claim@abengineering.sg <claim@abengineering.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 18 November 2022 5:37 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: claims@abwinleasing.sg 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING TO VEHICLE NOS : GBG7628H, GBB8061L BD4028A AT SIMS AVENUE, LOR 13 JUNCTION 
ON 30/10/22 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We are the registered owner of vehicle number GBG7628H which was involved on the above mentioned accident. 
 
Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number GBB8061L was insured with you at the material time of the said 
accident. We enclosed hereby the GIA report of GBG7628H for your kind attention. 
 
As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured vehicle number 
GBB8061L. Therefore , we are holding you liable for the repair costs and other consequential loss which was sustained 
by us. 
 
Kindly arrange your representative to survey our vehicle at 25 Senang Crescent, Singapore 416598 as soon as possible.  
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
Janelle 
 
25 Senang Crescent Singapore 416598 
TEL: +65 6749 9699 (Office)  l +65 6747 7791 (Fax) 
 


