Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 4:45 PM

To: SUR; woonmeng@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving YN3148T On 04.11.22 ( OD claim)

Dear Ms Heng,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle YN 3148T, Lump Sum
Repair.(Excess $1700/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 18 November 2022 1:01 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ionpac.com>

Subject: Accident involving YN3148T On 04.11.22 ( OD claim )

Dear Sir/Madam

Attached estimate for your reference. Kindly assist to arrange survey. (Vehicle In)
Location: 50, Bukit Batok Street 23, #01-06 Midview Building, S(659578)

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050



