Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Simon Ho (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, November 22, 2022 11:17 AM

To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: File Audit - SMG 9854C - CS/CTI22011591/Kwy3
Dear Xin Yu,

Audit check done for SMG9854C, found some parts prices need verification.

Best Regards,

Simon Ho

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561| email: simonho@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

[x] = Save the ELarth- FPrint only when necessary:

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 November 2022 10:33 am

To: Simon Ho (LKKAuto) <SimonHo@lkkauto.com>
Subject: File Audit - SMG 9854C - CS/CTI122011591/Kwy3

Dear Simon,

File for audit check.

Thanks and Warmest Regards,

Xin Yu

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



