LOT

Reference No - IHLBD@HgaS\[C Claim No,
\ N t

From (Personj : of

Priority - NORMAL / URGENT

W Bk lRer

DateTime : 74 DD

MV:§

IN OPS: Yes/No DOA:

TYPE:M.Car /M. Cycle s Bus / Van s Lorry / Taxi/ Prime Mover / Truck / Trailer or

Vehicle No : ‘{g §QHQJ D.O.A7A A Mo\/ 09D
Make & Modet: NEW CAR PRICE:$
Rogistration Date: MV:e_loK Quote by : CKG__.
COE Expiry Date: FS:s QoK Date
LTA Total Rebate Amount; (PARF) + (COE) = SV:§
Calculation for LTA Rebate: Calculation for Valuation:
{(3) COE Period: X12= Mths Average MV $
As At :
* = Mths Calculation for Repossessed vehicle:
: : = Mths High demand vehicle:  Yes/ No - $
(b) Balance Months : Parallel Import vehicle: Yes/ No -9
More than 10yrs clg: Yes / No - 3%
{d) Residue COE: QP X ..Q?_)_..____= . ‘MV or Repetussbed velilcls =3
(a) '
. Engine Capacity: High/low | - $
(a) - (b) =___/12=___<___yis Europe / Asla Car - $
Register Before/After MAY 2002 Car Condition: Good/Fair/Poor/Burnt | - $
(e) PARF = (OMV) X X = No. of transfer : ) - 3
LTA Total Rebate Amount: {d)+(e) “{Other deduction -3
Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 5%): Forced Sales Value derived = $

Date/ Time Acftion / Instruction

Additional Information:
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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 November 2022 5:35 PM
To: Lim Ai Lian

Cc: Vanessa Ngoi; Darren Lee

Subject: RE: [Encrypted]

Dear Miss Lim,
The valuation of GBL YQ XX48J is as below:
MV: $110K FS: S90K

As at November 2022

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lim Ai Lian <ailianlim@hlbank.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 November 2022 4:14 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vanessa Ngoi <vanessa.ngoi@hlbank.com.sg>; Darren Lee <darren.lee@hlbank.com.sg>
Subject: [Encrypted]

Hello Celine
Attached 1 log card and photos of the vehicle.

Please be informed that the vehicle is considered "Brand New" as it has not been on the road before. Vehicle
manufacture in 2017, registered in Jan 2022.

Please arrange to let us have a desktop valuation.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely

Lim Ai Lian
Assistant Manager

Collections

Credit



GL: +65 63498330 || DID: +65 65128365

1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881

3% HLBank

I BEST SME BANK // MALAYSIA's BESTSME BANK /i EXCELLENCE |
MALAYSIA AWARDS | ASIAMONEY AWARDS 2019 & 2020 | LEADERSHIP
THE ASIAN BANKER 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022 v

i “1 EUROMONEY A

i BEST CASH MANAGEMENT BANK
MALAYSIA AWARDS
THE ASIAN BANKER 2021

/¥ MALAYSIA’s BEST DIGITAL BANK
ASIAMONEY AWARDS 2019 & 2021

THANK YOU FOR THE TRUST SHOWN IN US

The information contained in this email and any attachment(s) is strictly confidential for information of the intended
recipient(s) only. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this email.
Please notify the sender immediately and delete this email from your system. HLB does not accept liability for

any unauthorised changes, errors or omissions in this email or viruses transmitted by this email or its attachments.

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient,
please immediately contact the sender and delete/destroy the message. Any disclosure, copying, or distribution of

the message by the unintended recipient, or any action or omission taken by such recipient in reliance onit, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 November 2022 4:53 PM
To: ‘Darren Lee'

Cc: Lim Ai Lian; Vanessa Ngoi

Subject: RE: [Encrypted] Re: [Encrypted]

Dear Darren,
Document well received.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Lee <darren.lee@hlbank.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 November 2022 4:45 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Lim Ai Lian <ailianlim@hlbank.com.sg>; Vanessa Ngoi <vanessa.ngoi@hlbank.com.sg>
Subject: [Encrypted] Re: [Encrypted]

Hi Celine
Please try again using my attachment

Thank you
Darren Lee

On Wed, Nov 16, 2022 at 4:38 PM Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ai Lian,

I’'m not able to open the attachment. Please assist to resend the log card.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lim Ai Lian <ailianlim@hlbank.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 November 2022 4:14 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vanessa Ngoi <vanessa.ngoi@hlbank.com.sg>; Darren Lee <darren.lee@hlbank.com.sg>
Subject: [Encrypted]

Hello Celine

Attached 1 log card and photos of the vehicle.

Please be informed that the vehicle is considered "Brand New" as it has not been on the road before. Vehicle
manufacture in 2017, registered in Jan 2022.

Please arrange to let us have a desktop valuation.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely

Lim Ai Lian
Assistant Manager
Collections

Credit

GL: +65 63498330 || DID: +65 65128365

1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881
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THANK YOU FOR THE TRUST SHOWN [N US

The information contained in this email and any attachment(s) is strictly confidential for information of the
intended recipient(s) only. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this
email. Please notify the sender immediately and delete this email from your system. HLB does not accept liability
for any unauthorised changes, errors or omissions in this email or viruses transmitted by this email or its
attachments.

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient,
please immediately contact the sender and delete/destroy the message. Any disclosure, copying, or distribution of
the message by the unintended recipient, or any action or omission taken by such recipient in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

Best Regards

Darren Lee
Collections ;
1 Wallich Street, #29-01 Guoco Tower, Singapore 078881

Website: www.hlbank.com.sg .

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient,
please immediately contact the sender and delete/destroy the message. Any disclosure, copying, or distribution of
the message by the unintended recipient, or any action or omission taken by such recipient in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enqunre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type: Company
Owner [D: .W
Vehicle Details ‘
Vehicle No.: YQ5248)
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 30 Nov 2022
Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Model: CANTER 3.0 MANUAL
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: » 2017
. Engine No.: 4P10C85290
ChassisNo.: - FEB50554390
Maximum Power Output: o -
Open Market Value: $37,257.00
Original Registration Date: 06 Jan 2022
First Registration Date: 06 Jan 2022
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: ' T $1,863.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details »
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: o -
PARF Rebate Amount; ' $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details -
COEExpiryDate: 05 Jan 2032
COE Category: o - C-Goods Vehicle &Bus
COE Period(Years): 10 .
PQP Paid: $33,178.00
COE Rebate Amount: $30,181.00
Total Rebate Amount: ' $30,181.00 )

The information contained he“rein is correct as at 16 Nov 2022

OK

Phops ineide Vied

MV: Z10¥

FQ « @40 1L



11/16/22, 5:45 PM Used Mitsubishi canter FEB Cars | Singapore Car Prices & Listing - Sgcarmart

sGecarmart

@ New Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Arficles Forum

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$68 until it's SOLD! o el A PEACE OF MIND
Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling G Automobile Centre HOT!.[N E: 6741 9997 iew our cars
sort by [Date Posted |
20 vehicles @ Mitsubishi canter FEB Any Category Advanced Search O
Make Model Price Depreciation Reg Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection Mitsubishi canter FEB Any Any 2022 Any Any Any

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21  $118,800 $12,320 /yr 07-Jul-2022 2,998 cc - Truck
Fuel Type: Diesel

14ft truck ideal for all business! Class 3 can drive. No vpc required. Can be arrange to do customisation at back! Come with free servicing
and warranty! Fast and easy loan!

SG Motor Link Pte Ltd
Posted: 16-Nov-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $124,988 $12,550 /yr 31-Oct-2022 2,998 cc - Truck
Fuel Type: Diesel

Latest Model 14Ft Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21! Ready Stock! Includes 3x Years Agent Warranty, 12x Agent Servicing, & 6 Month
Roadtax! Class 3 License can drive! No need VPC! Add On Full Canopy, Retractable Canopy, Tailgate Service Available too! 100% Loan W...

ABS Bus Pte Ltd
Posted: 16-Nov-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $124,988 $12,840 /yr 08-Aug-2022 2,998 cc - Truck

Fuel Type: Diesel

Ready stock, can hand over immediately. 3 years agent (Mitsubishi) warranty. 12 times free agent (Mitsubishi) servicing(Labor & Parts).
High trade in offer for your current vehicle. High loan can do. Please contact us to arrange for the viewing.

ABS Bus Pte Ltd
Posted: 16-Nov-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $120,800 $12,280 /yr 15-Sep-2022 2,998 cc - Truck
Fuel Type: Diesel

Latest Model 14Ft Lorry Mitsubishi Canter, auto/manual, No Need VPC, Class 3 Can Drive, Customization of Deck at Your Own Preference,
Come With Free Warranty & Servicing Up to 20times, Quick Call Us To Get Your Booking Done! Flexible Bank Loan Plan With Low Interest.

SG Motor Link Pte Ltd
Posted: 15-Nov-2022

2021 14FT Mitsubishi Fuso Canter (For Lease)
Brand New 14 ft Mitsubishi Canter for lease. Open, canopy, box and tailgate available as add-on.

More info about this vehicle

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $118,800 $12,240 /yr 29-Jul-2022 2,998 cc - Truck
Fuel Type: Diesel o
All New Mitsubishi Canter! Warranty & Servicing Package Available! Good for New Start Up Business, Warfafity and Free Servicing Under
agent. Hurry Call Now to Book an Appointment to View and Test Drive Now! 4
SG Motor Link Pte Ltd X
Posted: 14-Nov-2022
Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $119,800 $12,750 /yr 07-Apr-2022 2,998 cc - Truck

Fuel Type: Diesel

Good deal not to be missed! Mitsubishi 14 footer, Brand new unit. Class 3 driving license can drive, no VPC required, Powered by Fuso
technology on performance, safety features, Adblue effectively reduce harmful emission from diesel engines. Package comes with agent...

Ezy-1 Pte Ltd
Posted: 14-Nov-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $118,888 $12,170 /yr 23-Aug-2022 2,998 cc 102 km Truck
Fuel Type: Diesel
Agent unit, 14 feet truck, Class 3 can dr 100,000km whichever comes first, 12 times servicing free, bank or in

house loan available, trade in welcome!

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MOD=Mitsubishi+canter+ FEB&CAT=&AVL=2&RPG=20&AVL=2&VEH=0&RGD=2022
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11/16/22, 5:45 PM Used Mitsubishi canter FEB Cars | Singapore Car Prices & Listing - Sgcarmart

Posted: 14-Nov-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $101,800 $10,880 /yr 24-Mar-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available

Fuel Type: Diesel

The Best 14fter Lorry You Can Find In The Market. Cheapest In The Market. Class 3 Can Drive. No VPC Needed. 100% Loan Available. .
High Trade-In For Your Used Vehicle. Call Our Friendly Salesperson Now! L PREMIUMAD, |

Lek Auto Pte Ltd
Posted: 12-Nov-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $122,800 $12,290 /yr 10-Nov-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
Latest 14 feet lorry! Agent unit!
Hui Hua Credit Pte Ltd
Posted: 11-Nov-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $120,500 $12,130 /yr 20-Oct-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel

Best deals with Skylink Auto free front dash camera, full loan with $0 down-payment or flexible loan with in-house finance, fast approval,
We offer best rates for trade in. Come for viewing at WCEGA PLAZA, Mon-Sat 9am to 6pm or speak to our friendly representatives, [Ceremivnao ]

Skylink Auto Pte Ltd
Posted: 25-Oct-2022

ADVERTISING
Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $113,800 $12,090 /yr 14-Apr-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
14 feet lorry with full canopy and mild steel plate. Class 3 driving license, no VPC required, warranty 3 years or 100,000km, doorstep

viewing available upon request. 100% loan available, fast loan approval. Hassle free paperwork. Wait no more, drive this beauty home n...

Posted: 25-Oct-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $106,800 $11,450 /yr 14-Mar-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
14FT Truck Leader In The Market, Agent Warranty 3 Years Or 100,000km, Free 12 Servicing, Call For Viewing Or Enquiry!
Bell Auto Pte Ltd
Posted: 25-Oct-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $120,000 $12,100 /yr 14-Oct-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available

Fuel Type: Diesel

Top selling 14ft lorry in town! Class 3 license can drive! $0 drive away available! Attractive warranty by agent! Extremely powerful
workhorse and yet very low on maintenance! Diesel saving 14ft lorry! Save more then $2k worth of add on's! Attractive high loans packa...

Net Link Partners Pte Ltd
Posted: 21-Oct-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $118,800 $11,980 /yr 14-Oct-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel

New Mitsubishi Fuso FEB21, Auto transmission, Syears 200k km warranty with 12 x servicing, class 3 can drive, Flexible Loan available
with low Interest, Call Us Now For your booking today. PREMIUM AD

Net Link Partners Pte Ltd
Posted: 20-Oct-2022

Mitsubishi Fuso Canter FEB21 $119.800 $12,080 /yr 14-Oct-2022 2,998 cc - Truck Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
Latest 14ft truck with agent warranty, c: n drive, warranty 3 years or 100,000km whichever comes first, 12 times

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MOD=Mitsubishi+canter+ FEB&CAT=&AVL=2& RPG=20&AVL=2& VEH=0&RGD=2022 2/4



