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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Raymond Ting <raymond.ting@scauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 July 2023 9:39 AM
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR; Lee Mei Lin
Subject: RE: PC8883K / SKN8581H DOA 10/11/2022

Dear Kenneth, 
 
 
Content noted. 
 
We accept lump repair at $2,000 (before GST). 
 
 
Thank you. 
  
Regards: 
  
Raymond Ting 
Claim Executive 
D +65 6571 9958 
E raymond.ting@scauto.com.sg 

 
 
 

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 24 May 2023 7:03 pm 
To: Raymond Ting <raymond.ting@scauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PC8883K / SKN8581H DOA 10/11/2022 
 
AƩach finalise for PC 8883K, please check and confirm. Final amount subject to insurance approval thanks. 
 

From: Raymond Ting <raymond.ting@scauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, May 24, 2023 1:11 PM 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: PC8883K / SKN8581H DOA 10/11/2022 
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From: Lee Mei Lin <meilin.lee@scauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 21 April 2023 10:07 am 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Raymond Ting <raymond.ting@scauto.com.sg> 
Subject: PC8883K / SKN8581H DOA 10/11/2022 
 
Dear Kenneth, 
 
Please find aƩached photos for your kind ref. 
As spoken, Raymond will follow up on the marked esƟmate with you. 
 
 
Thanks and best regards, 
____________________________________________ 
Aelyne Lee Mei Lin 
Asst Manager (Customer Care Centre) 
D 6571 9981 
M 8611 8828 

 
 


