Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 November 2022 12:58 PM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: Crawford Ref : 1095870/G/KY | TTK Services Pte Ltd ( P/N.

SD19L02826/LPLCO/RO/EOQ ) - Damage To Third Party’s vehicle SLV 4391L at 485B
Tampines Ave 9 on 7 Feb 2022

Attachments: SLV 43911_LKKPhoto (7).pdf; SLV 4391L_LKKPreRepairlnspection.pdf; SLV4391L -
survey photographs.pdf; SNM22D200924- SLV4391L - invoice.PDF; Finalise Report -
SLV4391L.PDF

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Yee <kenneth.yee@crawford.asia>

Sent: Monday, 14 November 2022 11:20 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@Ikkauto.com>; Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@Ikkauto.com>; Ming Shu ONG
<mingshu.ong@crawford.asia>

Subject: RE: Crawford Ref : 1095870/G/KY | TTK Services Pte Ltd ( P/N. SD19L02826/LPLCO/RO/EO ) - Damage To
Third Party’s vehicle SLV 4391L at 485B Tampines Ave 9 on 7 Feb 2022

Dear Karen/ Veron
We refer to your email of 20 June 2022.

As you are aware, at the time of your report preparation, the workshop repairer did not submit their estimate. Your
office has thus provided an estimation of $57,000.00 for the repair work.

The Third Party’s loss adjuster, Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd has now submitted the claim documents to our office
and the repair cost amounted to $$21,256.61.

Please assist to review the documents provided by the Third Party’s loss adjuster, and let us have your assessment
and additional fee note for our further action.

Should you require any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact the undersigned.

Kenneth Yee (Mr)
Senior Manager
ACLA, ANZIIF (Snr Assoc), DipLA



Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd

P +65 6632 8662 M +65 8938 1683 F +65 6632 8040

E: kenneth.yee@crawford.asia

W www.crawco.com

A 6 Shenton Way, #19-10 OUE Downtown 2, Singapore 068809

From: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 2:11 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Yee <kenneth.yee@crawford.asia>

Subject: FW: Crawford Ref : 1095870/G/KY | TTK Services Pte Ltd ( P/N. SD19L02826/LPLCO/RO/EQ ) - Damage To
Third Party’s vehicle SLV 4391L at 485B Tampines Ave 9 on 7 Feb 2022

CAUTION: Email originated outside the organization. Do not open attachments or click links unless you are certain
the sender and content are safe.

Dear Veron,

Kindly assist Kenneth on the below mentioned, thank you

Best Regards,

Karen Ting | Accounts Dept.
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741 2674 Ext.127 | email: KarenTing@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Yee [mailto:kenneth.yee@crawford.asial

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 2:02 PM

To: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Ming Shu ONG
<mingshu.ong@crawford.asia>

Subject: RE: Crawford Ref : 1095870/G/KY | TTK Services Pte Ltd ( P/N. SD19L02826/LPLCO/RO/EO ) - Damage To
Third Party’s vehicle SLV 4391L at 485B Tampines Ave 9 on 7 Feb 2022

Dear Karen

Your repair proposal is not attached in your email.

Kenneth Yee (Mr)

Senior Manager

ACLA, ANZIIF (Snr Assoc), DipLA

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd

P +65 6632 8662 M +65 8938 1683 F +65 6632 8040

E: kenneth.yee@crawford.asia

W www.crawco.com

A 6 Shenton Way, #19-10 OUE Downtown 2, Singapore 068809
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From: Karen Ting (LKKAuto) <KarenTing@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 1:59 PM

To: Ming Shu ONG <mingshu.ong@crawford.asia>; Kenneth Yee <kenneth.yee@crawford.asia>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Crawford Ref : 1095870/G/KY | TTK Services Pte Ltd ( P/N. SD19L02826/LPLCO/RO/EQ ) - Damage To
Third Party’s vehicle SLV 4391L at 485B Tampines Ave 9 on 7 Feb 2022

CAUTION: Email originated outside the organization. Do not open attachments or click links unless you are certain
the sender and content are safe.

Dear Ming Shu,

Thanks for the payment and attached herewith report and photo for your reference, thank you

Best Regards,

Karen Ting | Accounts Dept.
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741 2674 Ext.127 | email: KarenTing@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Karen Ting (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 June 2022 12:56 PM

To: Ming Shu ONG <mingshu.ong@crawford.asia>; Kenneth Yee <kenneth.yee@crawford.asia>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Crawford Ref : 1095870/G/KY | TTK Services Pte Ltd ( P/N. SD19L02826/LPLCO/RO/EQ ) - Damage To Third
Party’s vehicle SLV 4391L at 485B Tampines Ave 9 on 7 Feb 2022

Dear Ming Shu,

We have completed the inspection report for the above mentioned.

Attached herewith our invoice for you to arrange payment at your early convenience.
Please notify us once payment done, thank you

Herewith our bank details :



Mame of Bank Account LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Name of Bank uoB Ltd

Bank —Branch No. 7375 - 016

Account No. 33%-301-593-8

Email address for remittance advice acoount@lkkauto.com

PAYNOW ID 192607198rR002

Swift Code UOWBSGSG

Best Regards,

Karen Ting | Accounts Dept.
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741 2674 Ext.127 | email: KarenTing@lkkauto.com | fax: 6844-8805

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This message and any files transmitted with it may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information
and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. No confidentiality or privilege is
waived or lost by any mistransmission. If you have received this message in error, please immediately delete it and
all copies of it from your system, destroy any hard copies of it and notify the sender. You must not review or in any
way use or publish the content to any party. Crawford reserves the right to monitor communications through its
network.

Think of the environment before printing out this message
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