Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 4, 2023 11:17 AM

Cc: assignments; Report; James Jordan; Xin Yu (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8
November 2022 (HFW Ref: 67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Attachments: SERVICE REQUES(5771179.1).pdf

Dear Meng Yan,

Please find attached a copy of the completed service request form.
We look forward to receiving the survey report.
Thank you.

Darryl Andrew Quek
Associate

D +65 6411 5349 | M +65 9667 0336
E darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com

HFW, 30 Raffles Place, #24-01, Singapore 048622
T | F +65 6411 5355 | hfw.com

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 January 2023 5:03 pm

To: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>; Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>; Xin Yu (LKK
Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Report <report@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022
(HFW Ref: 67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly chop and sign the Service Request Form and forward back to me to enable us to release the report.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 12:53 PM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>; Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>; Xin Yu
(LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022 (HFW Ref:
67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Importance: High

Thanks for following-up Darryl.

Further to Darryl's email, please can | ask that the survey report is sent to us as soon as possible as our
clients and the claimant are chasing for a response.

Best regards
James

James Jordan
Partner

D +65 6411 5374 | M +65 8123 3558
E james.jordan@hfw.com

HFW, 30 Raffles Place, #24-01, Singapore 048622
T +65 6411 5300 | F +65 6411 5355 | hfw.com

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 12:08 pm

To: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>; Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@I|kkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022
(HFW Ref: 67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Darryl,

Thank you for the email.



Dear Xin Yu,

Please assist. Our ref : CS/TP22011466/Uwy3

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>

Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 11:50 am

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022 (HFW Ref:
67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Meng Yan,

We refer to our email below and are writing to follow up on the survey report.

We shall be grateful if you could let us know when we might expect the report to be ready.
Thank you and wishing you a happy new year.

Darryl Andrew Quek
Associate

D +65 6411 5349 | M +65 9667 0336
E darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com

HFW, 30 Raffles Place, #24-01, Singapore 048622
T | F +65 6411 5355 | hfw.com



From: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 November 2022 4:03 pm

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022 (HFW Ref:
67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Yan,

We understand that LKK conducted a survey of YP 3793U on 16 November 2022.
We shall be grateful if you could let us know when the survey report will be ready.
Thank you.

Darryl Andrew Quek
Associate

D +65 6411 5349 | M +65 9667 0336
E darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com

HFW, 30 Raffles Place, #24-01, Singapore 048622
T | F +65 6411 5355 | hfw.com

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 5:28 pm

To: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022
(HFW Ref: 67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Darryl,
Noted with thanks.

We will arrange survey accordingly.

Best Regards,



Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 5:19 PM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assighments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022 (HFW Ref:
67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Meng Yan,

Thank you for your email.

You may proceed with re-inspection of the vehicle.

We have just received an email from the workshop requesting for inspection to be carried out tomorrow.
Will your surveyors be available tomorrow? If not, please let us know their earliest available time for us to
inform the workshop.

Regards,

Darryl Andrew Quek
Associate

D +65 6411 5349 | M +65 9667 0336
E darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com

HFW, 30 Raffles Place, #24-01, Singapore 048622
T | F +65 6411 5355 | hfw.com

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 12:28 pm

To: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022
(HFW Ref: 67925-302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Darryl,
Thank you for the email.

Our fee charged is $650(before gst), please advice if to proceed for physical inspection.



Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darryl Andrew Quek <darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 November 2022 10:39 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: James Jordan <james.jordan@hfw.com>

Subject: SURVEY OF YP 3793U - Accident involving YP 3793U and WC 7959A on 8 November 2022 (HFW Ref: 67925-
302) [HFW-HFWSP.FID2086931]

Dear Sirs,

By way of introduction, we act for SATS Ltd and their insurers in relation to the above captioned matter.
Briefly, there was an accident involving YP 3739U, belonging to Loaded Services Pte Ltd, ("the Claimant's
lorry") and WC 7959A, a SATS vehicle that was towing SATS container (BT 1350) at the time of the
accident. The SATS container (BT1350) subsequently came loose and impacted the front portion of the
Claimant's lorry. The Claimant's workshop has since provided repair estimates at $37,310.62.

We attach herewith copies of scene photographs showing the damage to the Claimant's lorry as well as the
repair estimates provided by Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd, the workshop appointed to repair the Claimant's lorry.

We would like to appoint your good office to conduct a physical survey of YP 3739U and provide a survey
report stating the reasonable costs of repairs of the Claimant's lorry.

In the circumstances, we shall be grateful if you could provide us your fee estimates for (a) conducting a
physical inspection; and (b) providing a survey report, as well as your availability for either end of this week
or early next week for our consideration.

We look forward to hearing from you on the above.

Thank you.

Darryl Andrew Quek
Associate

D +65 6411 5349 | M +65 9667 0336
E darrylandrew.quek@hfw.com

HFW, 30 Raffles Place, #24-01, Singapore 048622
T | F +65 6411 5355 | hfw.com
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