Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 5:54 PM

To: Finalization

Subject: RE: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)
Thank you

From: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 4:52 PM

To: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi Eric,

Revised the finalize advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $5905.56 (P/P, before GST), 4 days. Subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg <eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 3:52 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi Veron
Re-send

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 3:11 PM

To: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg

Subject: RE: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi,

Please call me



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg <eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 2:50 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: jkheng@autosprint.com.sg

Subject: FW: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi

We have omitted one more supplementary part in our previous finalization.
We now attached our latest final amount for your perusal.

Sorry on our part, please reconfirm — Thank you

Regards
Eric Tan
Autosprint Pte Ltd

From: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg <eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 11:06 AM

To: 'Finalization' <finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: jkheng@autosprint.com.sg

Subject: RE: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Dear Admin
This revised amount is correct, please submit your survey report to Insurer.

We will submit our Letter of Demand by next week.

Thank you & Regards
Eric Tan
Autosprint Pte Ltd.

From: Finalization <finalization@I|kkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 10:41 AM
To: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg

Cc: jkheng@autosprint.com.sg

Subject: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi Eric,

Kindly refer revise finalize $5862.00 (P/P, before GST). 4 days



Thanks.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg <eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 10:05 AM

To: Finalization <finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: jkheng@autosprint.com.sg <jkheng@autosprint.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Dear Bryan

| have resubmitted our revised finalise amount for your perusal.

We also show you our Supplier Invoice as our profit margin is only 20% markup, please see * on the Work Order.
Please see attached document.

Thank you & have a nice day

Eric Tan
Autosprint Pte Ltd.

From: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 6:16 PM

To: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg

Subject: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi Eric,

Kindly refer our finalize. $5616.30 (P/P, before GST). 4 days.

Thanks

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




Thanks.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2022 4:58 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi
Please follow up this case with workshop.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 4:55 pm

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi
Please forward this case to Steve for his follow up.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg <eric.tan@autosprint.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 13 December 2022 11:17 am

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMJ778H Finalization (survey by Steve)

Hi Bryan
Please see attached & finalized the above car asap, understand Steve had left the company.
Best regards

Eric Tan
Autosprint Pte Ltd.



