Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 7:07 PM

To: Finalization

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: Re: PC216P--Check Item, After Paint & Sup Estimate *** LKK REF: CS/CTI22011445/Eqy3
Hi,

Thank you for your reply, please advise if the COR is confirm.
Rgds
Alan

On Wed, Jan 4, 2023, 19:02 Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Alan,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $19,950.00 (L/S, before GST), 12 days. Subject to their approval.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 |
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 January 2023 5:53 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: PC216P--Check Item, After Paint & Sup Estimate

Hi Mei Kwan,
| understand Steve has left LKK, please help me with this case, thank you.

Rgds
Alan

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Date: Fri, Dec 9, 2022 at 5:28 PM

Subject: PC216P--Check Item, After Paint & Sup Estimate
To: <stevechen@lkkauto.com>

Hi Steve,
Attached are the above-mentioned items, thank you.

**Please relook into the LH fender compensation as it was found cracked after we dismantled the rear bumper.
**Attached is a sup estimate for the rear bumper number plate LED lamp.
**** Photos supported in the check item for both above-mentioned items.

Thank you.

Rgds

Alan Tan

83868989

AT Auto Consultant



Rgds

Alan Tan

83868989

AT Auto Consultant



