Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 14 November 2022 8:27 AM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Julie Mangubat; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10018577/JM || OI- SLW9568G (Blue) TP- SLV3362C || Est:
$0.00 || Profi Automotive

Attachments: C10018577 zip

Importance: High

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SLV3362C

Profi Automotive

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2,
#01-05, First East Centre,
Singapore 417868

Contact: Edward Ow - 94335558
Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose | Platinum
| Trusted
Service

E‘udg‘et Award

For consistently

- Direct | siawx
msurance

From: Profi Automotive <profi.automotive@asia.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 November 2022 5:17 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 11.11.2022 || Ourf: C10018577/IM | | Notice of Accident | | SLV3362C against
SLW9568G

Importance: High

Dear Salizawati,
Please see the attached for the GIA report. Oue choice is LKK.

KINDLY BE REMINDED OF THE CHANGE OF OUR ADDRESS AS STATED BELOW.
10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #01-05, FIRST EAST CENTRE. SINGAPORE 417868.

Warmest regards,
Edward Ow



Profi Automotive

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2,
#01-05, First East Centre,
Singapore 417868

M: 94335558

E: profi.automotive@asia.com

Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 at 3:28 PM

From: "Claims" <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

To: "Profi Automotive" <profi.automotive@asia.com>

Cc: "Julie Mangubat" <julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: PRI Request on 11.11.2022 || Ourf: C10018577/IM || Notice of Accident || SLV3362C against
SLW9568G

Dear Edward,

Just to check with you whether your client have made the accident reporting?

If yes, kindly furnish us the full GIA report before we can arrange for the survey.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar

Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853

E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose | Platinum
Trusted
Service

Budget |Awod

d
Direct | siawx

insurance

From: Profi Automotive <profi.automotive@asia.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 November 2022 1:42 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Notice of Accident || SLV3362C against SLW9568G (Your insured)
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sirs,

Please see the attached. Thank you.

KINDLY BE REMINDED OF THE CHANGE OF OUR ADDRESS AS STATED BELOW.
10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #01-05, FIRST EAST CENTRE. SINGAPORE 417868.

Warmest regards,
Edward Ow

Profi Automotive

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2,
#01-05, First East Centre,
Singapore 417868

M: 94335558

E: profi.automotive@asia.com




