Vero,ri’then (LKKAuto)

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PaulLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 9:12 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Meng Yan (LKK Auto); assignments; SUR

Subject: Please review third party cost of repair as Insured express concerns ; RE: LKK - LIST
\ CMTD2204077/GPL - Our Client : SLV 6509 C Your Insured : SE 9339 M, D.OA :
08/11/2022

Importance: High

Dear M/s LKK AUTO,

With reference above, our insured has emailed as screenshot below, his concerns of third party cost of repair
as it was quoted by third party thru text message that the repair quote was S 4 K !

[

Kindly forward to surveyor to review and ensure consistency of damages, thank you. 7A’j i po,/ 6‘4/4

ryrciys 0/7/7'

From: Oh Chia Wee <ohchiawee@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 24, 2022 5:40 PM

To: Gnoh, Pau Loong

Ce: ) eileen.pang@prolink.sg; alexea@hubdistributors.com y
Subject: Re: For your ref : SE9339M ; Sompo ref : CMTD2204077/GPL

CAUTION: This Email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this sender (Email) before replying or clicking on
any links and open attachments.

Dear Mr Gnoh,

Please refer to the sms conversation as mentioned yesterday. Hope this evidence can helps with the insurance claim
assessment on the repair cost.



