Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 2:44 PM

To: ‘Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)'
Cc: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SG5700T photo

Dear Catherine,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $792.00- with 2 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Catherine.Lee@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 December 2022 2:52 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SG5700T photo

Hi Veron,

Please refer to the inserted email for details.

Thank you

Best Regards

Catherine Lee

Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(Accident Repair & Overhaul)

DID: 6866 2669 Fax: 6368 5592
Email: catherine.lee@strides.com.sg

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 December 2022 02:34 pm

To: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Catherine.Lee@strides.com.sg>
Subject: SG5700T photo

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender
and are expecting the content or attachment.




Dear Catherine,

Kindly assist to finalize.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 November 2022 11:26 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: # J/x: SG5700T photo

R4 A Jeong Choon Hwee (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <ChoonHwee.Jeong@strides.com.sg>
B ki%: 20224F11 A11H 11:25:56 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

e A Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Ff8: SG5700T photo

Hi Guo Qiang,
Photo & estimate fyna please.

Regards,
Edy



