Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 11 November 2022 9:38 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: TP DS claim: [EXT] Fwd: Invite for PRS of Vehicle No. YQ5893X; ACCIDENT

INVOLVING YQ5893X and YP9501G on 27/10/2022 ALONG UBI AVE 1

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 November 2022 8:21 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Maya N <vmol@bigfoot.com.sg>

Subject: TP DS claim: [EXT] Fwd: Invite for PRS of Vehicle No. YQ5893X; ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ5893X and YP9501G on
27/10/2022 ALONG UBI AVE 1

Internal

Your ref: YQ5893X;
Our ref: 2022 22008051FR-YP9501G

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

8,100 KOON
ROAD, S (628972)
MR. ROSLEE PUASA
/ MS MAYA
97481150/
63505050

Address of Survey Location :

Name of Contact Person :

Contact Number :




Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QO | Alianz @ | (.

Werldwide Olympl ond Parolympic Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Maya N <vmol@bigfoot.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2022 5:55 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Roslee Puasa <roslee@bigfoot.com.sg>; Management <Ist-management@bigfoot.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Fwd: Invite for PRS of Vehicle No. YQ5893X; ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ5893X and YP9501G on 27/10/2022
ALONG UBI AVE 1

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the email below requesting for your in-house surveyor to carry out the PRS of our vehicle YQ5893X.
Your insured vehicle is YP9501G.

Thank you.

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Maya N <vmol @bigfoot.com.sg>

Date: Thu, Nov 3, 2022 at 10:37 AM

Subject: Invite for PRS of Vehicle No. YQ5893X; ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ5893X and YP9501G on 27/10/2022 ALONG
UBI AVE 1

To: <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Roslee Puasa <roslee@bigfoot.com.sg>, Management <|st-management@bigfoot.com.sg>

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above-mentioned subject matter and our GIA report is attached herewith for your attention.



We invite your in-house surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey (PRS) on our vehicle YQ5893X at the location below:

8, Joo Koon Road
Singapore 628972

Kindly let us know the date and time for the PRS.

Survey Type
(Please indicate New or Resurvey) NEW
Vehicle to be surveyed : YQ5893X
ALLIANZ INSURANCE Insured Vehicle : YP9501G
Date of Accident : 27/10/2022
Date of Survey : TBA
BIG-FOOT ENGINEERING
Name of Workshop : PTE LTD
. 8,J00 KOON ROAD, S
Address of Survey Location : (628972)
) MR. ROSLEE PUASA / MS
Name of Contact Person : MAYA
Contact Number : 97481150/ 63505050
Any Undercarriage involved :
(Please indicate Yes or No) NO
Thank you.




