Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2022 12:43 PM

To: Kenneth Ding

Cc: Claims@dingauto.sg; SA0406 @DINGAUTO.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SMW4284X - OD CLAIM

Attachments: SMW4284X - EST.PDF

Dear Henry,

Please proceed with the revised items as attached with our surveyor marking.

Thanks and Warmest Regards,

Xin Yu

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, November 14, 2022 2:16 PM

To: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Cc: Claims@dingauto.sg; SA0406 @DINGAUTO.SG; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SMW4284X - OD CLAIM

Dear Henry,
Attached herewith our surveyor marking.

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMW 4284X (Excess $3,100/-) Repair Days:
4 days.

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thanks and Warmest Regards,

Xin Yu

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: XinYu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 November 2022 11:57 AM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Lynn Yap (Ding Auto)
<Claims@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: SMW4284X - OD CLAIM




Dear Yan,
Attached accident photos for your perusal. Thank you.

Henry Lee
Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

On Fri, Nov 11, 2022 at 11:28 AM Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406 @dingauto.sg> wrote:

Dear Yan,

Yes vehicle parked at Blk 10 #01-20 Sin Ming Ind Est Sec.C S
575645.

Henry Lee
Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

On Fri, Nov 11, 2022 at 11:17 AM Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Henry,
Noted with thanks.

Is the vehicle in the workshop?

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 November 2022 11:15 AM

To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Lynn Yap (Ding Auto)
<Claims@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: SMW4284X - OD CLAIM

Dear Yan,

We refer to the above matter, insured have informed us to
proceed
with the OD claim. Thank you.



Henry Lee
Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

On Thu, Nov 10, 2022 at 10:40 AM Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Kenneth,

As spoken, due to Excess $600.00 + $2500.00(YIED) = $3100.00
Please inform insured if they still wish to proceed with this OD claim?

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



