Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 6:27 PM

To: geraldpoh@lonpac.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: SURVEY INVITATION for Accident Involving GBH1591M & GBJ1328Y at Airport
Road Twds KPE on 02.11.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC22011254/pa3

Attachments: TP FRONT VIDEO.mp4; TP GIA REPORT.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP video footage

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 11:02 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: SURVEY INVITATION for Accident Involving GBH1591M & GBJ1328Y at Airport Road Twds KPE on
02.11.2022.

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref: TBA

Dear Meng Yan,

FYNA. Insured yet to report.

Best Regards



Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 10:47 am

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@I|onpac.com>; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Cc: ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY INVITATION for Accident Involving GBH1591M & GBJ1328Y at Airport Road Twds KPE on
02.11.2022.

Dear Claim Officer,

We refer to the above matter. (DOA 02/11/2022)

We are the appointed repair workshop of vehicle no. GBH1591M.
We understand that you are the insurer of vehicle no. GBJ1328Y .

The owner of the vehicle no. GBH1591M has authorised us to carry out the repairs to their vehicle which was damaged
by your insured’s vehicle. The owner intends to make a claim against your insured and/or insured’s authorised driver for
the accident which is caused wholly and /or contributed by your insured and/or your insured’s authorised driver’s
negligence.

We hereby give you notice of the accident and an opportunity to inspect the damages to the vehicle prior to the
commencement of the repair.

Contact Person: Jessie H/P: 8723 3003 / Ezel H/P: 8721 3003

Has your insured reported already? Please advise on the liability.

Thanks

Regards,

Jessie Ong

Accident Claim Supervisor

Tel: +65 8723 3003

Email: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way,Singapore 508734

*=x As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

NOTE : WE HAVE RELOCATED TO : 37 LOYANG WAY S(508734)
Kindly forward all corresponding to this address with immediate effect.
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