Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 10:03 AM

To: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: AIS REF: TBC/FR-XD9601B - Third Party Claim --- XE6942G and XD9601B (your ref.)

; DOA: 04.10.2022

Categories: HMK

Dear Janice,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 5:17 PM

To: admin-d <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIS REF: TBC/FR-XD9601B - Third Party Claim --- XE6942G and XD9601B (your ref.) ; DOA: 04.10.2022

Internal

Dear Survey Firm,
Please retrieved documents via Allianz FileXchange link below and create claim in Merimen accordingly.

File: XE6942G - Q.pdf, XE6942G - SAS (221004).pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=432caa6a-2519-43e7-abb5-cb1dafe0a084-
78ab0ba635fe4641

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 11/15/2022

Ol Non Report.

Password: Allianz1

Ol Agent: allinkins@allink.com.sg
Contact: 6567 4722

Thank you



Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) | (.w

Warldwides Olymplc ond Poralymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Sent: 8 November, 2022 05:14 PM

To: 'ASM Jaclyn' <jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg>

Subject: AIS REF: TBC/FR-XD9601B - Third Party Claim --- XE6942G and XD9601B (your ref.) ; DOA: 04.10.2022

Your ref: XE6942G
Our ref: TBC/FR-XD9601B

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Ol Non report

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQ | Alianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: ASM Jaclyn <jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg>

Sent: 8 November, 2022 11:07 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Third Party Claim --- XE6942G and XD9601B (your ref.) ; DOA: 04.10.2022

2




Dear Sir / Madam,

Our client, the owner of XE 6942 G wished to file claim for the damages resulted from the above-stated accident,
against your insured, the owner of vehicle XD 9601 B.

We hereby append a copy of SAS and estimate for your reference. Kindly advise on liability before survey.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jaclyn Lai

Assistant Manager

Claims & Operation

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

No. 13, Pioneer Sector 1, Singapore 628424.

Hp: 9236 8218 | DID: 62650026 | Fax: 6265 6068
Web: www.asmauto.com.sg




