
1

Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 10:16 AM
To: assignments; admin-d
Cc: MTPRI; Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
Subject: FW: Accident between SHC4504B & FBJ604G

Ref: TAX/10/22/2099 
 
Dear Yan, 
 
Kindly survey on “ Without Prejudice” basis. 
 
TP: FBJ604G 
Insured: SHC4504B 
Workshop: WING YAP MOTOR 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
 
Hua Yen 
Claim Department 
 
Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705 

DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg 
 

From: kelvin@wingyap.com.sg <kelvin@wingyap.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 3:13 pm 
To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Accident between SHC4504B & FBJ604G 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender 
and are expecting the content or attachment.  

Good Afternoon,  
 

We would like to do a claim against SHC4504B. 

 
 
 
 
 

Best Regards  
Kelvin 
Marketing & Operations Executive 
 
  
Official Site : www.wingyap.com.sg 
Wing Yap's FaceBook FanPage :http://www.facebook.com/WingYapMotorSG 
Twitter : @wingyapmotor 
AXS Direct HP Re-Payment Mode - Islandwide - 24/7  
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Head Office  
No.627 Balestier Road, Singapore 329916 
Tel: 6253 8398 / 6251 9167 
Fax: 6256 6902 
 
Branch  
No.615 Balestier Road, Singapore 329916 
Tel: 6256 6902 
 
Branch  
4003 Ang Mo Kio Ave 10, Industrial Park 1, Singapore 569624 
Tel: 6456 0018 
Fax: 6451 3338 
 
*** Please consider your environmental responsibility. Do you really need a hard copy? ***  
 
CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of 
the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, 
confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message 
is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or 
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in 
error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 
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Official Site : www.wingyap.com.sg 
Wing Yap's FaceBook FanPage :http://www.facebook.com/WingYapMotorSG 
Twitter : @wingyapmotor 
AXS Direct HP Re-Payment Mode - Islandwide - 24/7  
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