Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 8:53 AM
To: Zoom Autowerks

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Letter of Claim for SMM 9886 D

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$6,900.00(all in) in full and
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured
arising out of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization /
Warrant to Act , REPAIR INVOICE and your Bank details for us to process payment.

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 06 NOV 2022.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 January 2023 11:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Letter of Claim for SMM 9886 D

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We confirm acceptance, please send us DV.

Warmest Regards,



Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd

130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
®9450 7920
YBzoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -

On Wed, Jan 11, 2023 at 12:31 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,900.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)



From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 5 January 2023 11:08 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Letter of Claim for SMM 9886 D

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for your email. Please consider our counter proposal:

1) Vehicle Repair Costs $6,000.00

2) Loss of Rental (SGD$130.00 x 8Days) $1,040.00
3) Insurance Search Fee $2.00

4) Purchase of GIA Report $31.00

Total : $7,073.00

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130

9450 7920

“Bzoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -



On Thu, Jan 5, 2023 at 3:00 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,660.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 December 2022 12:02 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Letter of Claim for SMM 9886 D




Dear Hsiao Tong,

- Without Prejudice -

Enclosed please find Letter of Claim for your kind attention.

Look forward to your favorable reply.

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
@9450 7920

“Bzoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -



