Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

dominic loke <lokedom@yahoo.com>

Tuesday, 8 November 2022 8:00 PM

Dilip Kumar

Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore); admin-d; assignments

Re: AIS REF: TBC-KC-SLM1307Z - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - YOUR INSURED VEHICLE:
SLM1307Z - DOA: 29.10.2022

Yes pls give us the contact number to arrange the pre inspections or they can contract me direct at 83882013 Dominic
LOKE to arrange the date the car is currently in our workshop Thks .

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Tuesday, November 8, 2022, 7:22 PM, Dilip Kumar <dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Dominic

This no is our client - 83882013 dom

| need the contact no and person to call LKK for the pre-inspection survey.

Or do you make the arrangement with LKK to contact our client for the pre-inspection survey.

Please advise as we are totally confused with your arrangement.

As we understand that once we select the SJE, you will make the arrangements. ( we will not have the
contact no and person in charge)

Regards
Dilip Kumar

GAVAN LAW PRACTICE LLC

111 North Bridge Road
#24-03 Peninsula Plaza

Singapore 179098

Contact: (65) (6333 1323 | Fax: (65) (6333 1326)
Email : dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg

On Tue, Nov 8, 2022 at 7:17 PM dominic loke <lokedom@yahoo.com> wrote:

83882013 dom

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Tuesday, November 8, 2022, 7:15 PM, Dilip Kumar <dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg> wrote:




Dear Sir

1. Please let us have the contact number to arrange for the pre-inspection survey.

Regards

Dilip Kumar

GAVAN LAW PRACTICE LIC

111 North Bridge Road
#24-03 Peninsula Plaza
Singapore 179098

Contact: (65) (6333 1323 | Fax: (65) (6333 1326)
Email : dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg

On Tue, Nov 8, 2022 at 6:54 PM Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)
<claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:

Internal

Your ref: DK/0078/2022

Our ref: TBC-KC-SLM13072Z

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.

Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management



Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) | (.o

Waorldwide Olymplc ond Porolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read,
copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then
please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Dilip Kumar <dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg>

Sent: 8 November, 2022 03:24 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: dominic loke <lokedom@yahoo.com>

Subject: [EXT] Re: AIS REF: TBC-KC-SLM1307Z - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - YOUR
INSURED VEHICLE: SLM1307Z - DOA: 29.10.2022

Dear Banca

1. We appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Regards
Dilip Kumar
GAVAN LAW PRACTICE L1LC

111 North Bridge Road

#24-03 Peninsula Plaza

Singapore 179098

Contact : (65) (6333 1323 | Fax : (65) (6333 1326)
Email : dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg



On Tue, Nov 8, 2022 at 2:37 PM Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)
<claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:

Internal

Your Ref: DK/0078/2022
Our Ref : TBC-KC-SLM1307Z

Dear Sirs

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

e AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd

e A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
e Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd

e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg



OQ | Alianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read,
copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then
please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Dilip Kumar <dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg>

Sent: 7 November, 2022 03:34 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: dominic loke <lokedom@yahoo.com>

Subject: [EXT] Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - YOUR INSURED VEHICLE: SLM1307Z -
DOA: 29.10.2022

Dear Janice

1. Attach please find the following:-

a. GlA report of SJV 7070S

B. LTA search fee of SLM 130727

2. On a separate note, can Janice call me, Sophia Tan at HP: 96914218. Long time
never talk to you.

Regards
Dilip Kumar
GAVAN LAW PRACTICE LLC

111 North Bridge Road



#24-03 Peninsula Plaza
Singapore 179098

Contact : (65) (6333 1323 | Fax : (65) (6333 1326)
Email : dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg

On Sat, Nov 5, 2022 at 1:40 PM Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)
<claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:

Internal

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly provide us your client GIA report and LTA search fee.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact
our Claims Department at claims@allianz.com.sg

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg



OQ | Alianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and
may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do
not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender
immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Dilip Kumar <dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg>

Sent: 4 November, 2022 03:51 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: dominic loke <lokedom@yahoo.com>

Subject: [EXT] PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - YOUR INSURED VEHICLE: SLM 1307Z

Dear Sir

1. Attach please see our letter dated 4 November 2022 for your attention.

Regards
R Dilip Kumar

GAVAN LAW PRACTICE LLC
111 North Bridge Road

#24-03 Peninsula Plaza

Singapore 179098

Contact : (65) (6333 1323 | Fax : (65) (6333 1326)
Email : dilipkumar@gavanlaw.com.sg



