Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 November 2022 7:00 PM

To: Kuru & Co

Cc: admin-d; assignments

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY // OUR REF: L22.0852.¢j // AIS REF: 2022 22007941/FR-

SMJ6363G // ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 5117M AND SMJ 6363G ON 04.11.2022

Internal

Your ref: L22.0852.¢j
Our ref: 2022 22007941/FR-SMJ6363G

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Thank you.

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQP | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwides Olymplc ond Porolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: 8 November, 2022 04:56 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] PRE-REPAIR SURVEY // OUR REF: L22.0852.cj // AIS REF: 2022 22007941/FR-SMJ6363G // ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBJ 5117M AND SMJ 6363G ON 04.11.2022

Dear Sirs
We refer to your email of same date.

Our client is agreeable to the following surveyor(s) as the SJE: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client’s vehicle at the following address:



GOH LEE HWA AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
Blk 5033 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2 #01-255
Singapore 569536

Tel: Alfred /91454773

Please instruct your surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and complete the pre-repair
survey within 2 working days of his appointment.

Kindly let us have the pre-repair and/or post repair survey report upon completion of the survey(s).

As solicitors on record, our client shall look to you for payment of our legal costs plus disbursements should
you reach a direct settlement with our client’s repairer.

Regards

Irene

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential
information and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error, please notify us immediately by return
email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.

On Tuesday, 8 November 2022 at 03:59:21 pm SGT, Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)
<claims@allianz.com.sg> wrote:

Internal

Your Ref: L22.0852.cj/ GBJ5117M

Our Ref : 2022 2200794 1/FR-SMJ6363G

Dear Sirs

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

e AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
e A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
e Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd



e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.
Best regards,

Janice Koh
Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

OQ | Alianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: 8 November, 2022 09:26 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>; customerservice@allianz.com.sg; Bin
Rosli, Muhammad Faiz (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <muhammad-faiz.bin-rosli@allianz.sg>

Subject: [EXT] PRE-REPAIR SURVEY // OUR REF: L22.0852.cj // YR REF: SMJ 6363G // ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBJ 5117M AND SMJ 6363G ON 04.11.2022

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 5117M AND SMJ 6363G ON 04.11.2022
AT/ALONG CTE TOWARDS TOWN (AFTER BRADDELL)

NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

3



We act for Mega Power Engrg And Trading, whose vehicle registration number GBJ 5117M was damaged in
the above accident.

A copy of our client’s Singapore Accident Statement is enclosed.

Before our client proceeds with repairs, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this
notice whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed with repairs
without further reference to you.

Regards
Irene

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential information
and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If you have received in error, please notify us immediately by return email, delete
this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein.



