Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Finalization

Sent: Friday, 6 January 2023 5:14 PM

To: Elise Law

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: SKC3097E - Before Paint, After Paint, & Supplier Bills
Attachments: SKC3097E _ EST (2).PDF; SKC3097E supp.pdf

Hi Elise,

Noted.

Thanks.

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, January 6, 2023 4:38 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SKC3097E - Before Paint, After Paint, & Supplier Bills

Hi,

We accept the cost of repair $3129.60, 4 days.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elise Law
Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015

On Wed, 4 Jan 2023 at 19:38, Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Shiau Chan,

I've checked the Finalize $3129.60, 4 days. Please counter check.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Finalization <finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 4, 2023 7:25 PM

To: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: SKC3097E - Before Paint, After Paint, & Supplier Bills

Hi Elise,



Kindly upload in the Merimen.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, January 4, 2023 6:15 PM

To: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SKC3097E - Before Paint, After Paint, & Supplier Bills

Hi Shiau Chan,

Enclosed the aircon condenser photo for your reference.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Elise Law
Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTELTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921
Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015

On Wed, 4 Jan 2023 at 17:52, Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Elise,

Kindly request ? item 15 (Aircond Condenser) photo.

Best Regards,
Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6256-3561 fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 26 November 2022 10:24 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: #% J/x: SKC3097E - Before Paint, After Paint, & Supplier Bills

RN Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>

S Ri%: 2022 4F 11 A 26 H 10:22:57 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
ek A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

#i%: Keong <keong@successunited.com.sg>

E8: SKC3097E - Before Paint, After Paint, & Supplier Bills

Hi Guo Qiang,



Enclosed the above documents for your reference.
Appreciate your prompt finalisation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elise Law
Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub
Singapore 417921
Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015



